
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
AGENDA 

Tuesday, April 2, 2024 
7:00 P.M. (CST) 

Wilmington City Hall 
1165 S. Water Street (Council Chambers) 

A. CALL TO ORDER

1. Pledge of Allegiance
2. Roll Call

Mayor Ben Dietz
Alderpersons: Kevin Kirwin, Ryan Jeffries, Dennis Vice, Ryan Knight

      Leslie Allred, Jonathan Mietzner, Thomas Smith, Todd Holmes 

B. CITIZENS COMMENT (State your full name clearly; limit 3 minutes each)

C. CONSENT AGENDA
All items listed on the Consent Agenda are considered to be routine by the City Council and will be acted upon with one motion. 
There will be no separate discussion of these items unless a Council member requests, in which event, the items will be removed 
from the consent agenda and discussed separately.

1. Approval of the Regular Meeting Minutes from March 20, 2024
2. Approval of the Accounts Payable Report

D. MAYOR’S REPORT

E. PLANNING & ZONING

1. Consideration to Approve the PZC Recommendation to authorize and approve the construction of a new
199-foot monopole wireless communication tower with support equipment at 29745 Elion Boulevard in 
Wilmington, IL as requested by petitioner LLC Telecom Services, acting on behalf of VB BTS II, LLC 
conditioned on verification of common electrical path to the tower and municipal colocation space, space 
and height to be determined

F. ORDER OF BUSINESS

1. Consideration to Approve the Hire of the Building Permit Technician, effective start date April 1, 2024
2. Consideration to Award the Bid to Hoerr Construction, Inc for $652,215.00 for the Kankakee Street 

Sewer Lining Project
3. Consideration to Approve the Purchase of Residential Water Meters from Utility Pipe Sales for a total 

cost of $33,921

G. REPORTS AND COMMUNICATION FROM CITY OFFICIALS
City Attorney – Bryan Wellner
City Administrator – Jeannine Smith
Finance Director – Nancy Gross
Public Works Director – James Gretencord
Police Department – Chief Zink

H. ALDERMEN COMMENTS
Alderperson Kirwin Alderperson Vice Alderperson Allred Alderperson Holmes 
Alderperson Jeffries Alderperson Knight Alderperson Mietzner Alderperson Smith 



Posting Date: 
3/28/2024 1:45 PM jz 

I. EXECUTIVE SESSION

1. Appointment, Employment, Dismissal, Compensation, Discipline, and Performance of an Employee of
the City of Wilmington [ILCS 120/2(c)(1)]

2. Collective negotiating matters between the City of Wilmington (public body) and its employees [ILCS
120/2(c)(2)]

3. Matters of Land Acquisition [ILCS 2(c)(5) and 2(c)(6)]
4. Probable or Imminent Litigation and Pending Litigation [ILCS 2(c)(11)]

J. POSSIBLE ACTION OF EXECUTIVE SESSION ITEMS

1. Consideration and Approval of Proposed Compensation of Non-Bargaining Employees

K. ADJOURNMENT

This public body may adjourn to a closed session to discuss matters so permitted 
and may act upon such matters returning to the open session. 

So that all may concentrate on the proceedings,  
please silence cell phones during City Council meetings. 

The next regularly scheduled City Council meeting is Tuesday, April 16, 2024. 
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MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE WILMINGTON CITY COUNCIL 
MARCH 20, 2024 

 
 

DEPUTY CITY CLERK JOIE ZILLER CALLED TO ORDER THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE WILMINGTON 
CITY COUNCIL AT 7:07 P.M.  
 
ELECT PRO TEM MAYOR 
Alderperson Holmes made a motion and Alderperson Vice seconded to nominate Alderperson Jeffries as Pro 
Tem Mayor for the March 20, 2024 City Council meeting      
 
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 6 Holmes, Vice, Kirwin, Mietzner, Jeffries, Smith 
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Knight, Allred 

The motion carried. 
 
ROLL CALL  
After the pledge of allegiance, the following answered to Roll Call: Alderpersons Kevin Kirwin, Ryan Jeffries, 
Dennis Vice, Jonathan Mietzner, Todd Holmes, and Thomas Smith. Absent Ryan Knight and Leslie Allred. The 
number present constitutes a quorum.  
 
Also present: City Administrator Jeannine Smith, Finance Director Nancy Gross, Public Works Director James 
Gretencord, Chief of Police Adam Zink, City Attorney Bryan Wellner, and Deputy City Clerk Joie Ziller.  
 
CITIZENS COMMENT 
Delvonnie Burgess of the U.S. Small Business Administration introduced herself to the Council and reminded 
the public that her agency will assist homeowners and business owners with the ice jam/flooding disaster that 
occurred January 15-25, 2024. The temporary Disaster Outreach Center is at the Wilmington Lion’s Club at 805 
River Street until March 29th at 4 PM.     
 
CONSENT AGENDA 
1. Approval of the Regular Meeting Minutes from March 5, 2024   
2. Approval of the Accounts Payable Report  
3. Proclamation – Recognizing the Month of April as Senior Citizen Month in the City of Wilmington  
4. Approval & Authorization for the City Administrator to Execute a Memorandum of Understanding with the 

Heritage Corridor Convention and Visitors Bureau for the South Island Park LED Sign  
5. Award the Façade Improvement Grant in the Amount of $5,000.00 to John Thayer for 204 N. Water Street 

Improvements  
6. Consideration to Award the Façade Improvement Grant in the Amount of $5,000.00 to The Watch Shop 

LLC for 208 N. Water Street Improvements   
7. Approve to Sponsor the Great American Road Trip 2.0 for $750.00 
8. Approve the Quote Provided by Axon Enterprises, Inc. in the Amount of $94,455.48 
9. Approve Resolution No. 2024-04, A Resolution to Dispose of Surplus Property (Fujitsu Lifebook & Tablet) 
10. Approve Resolution No. 2024-05, A Resolution Authorizing Participation as a Member in the Illinois 

Emergency Management Mutual Aid System Response Pursuant to an Intergovernmental Agreement for 
the Establishment of a Mutual Aid Intergovernmental Service Agreement   

11. Approve An Ordinance Amending Section 74.02 of the City of Wilmington Code of Ordinances Regarding 
the Operation of Golf Carts within the City of Wilmington TABLED 

12. Approve the State of Illinois CY2024-CY2025 Rock Salt Contract Joint Participation Agreement 
13. Approve Invoices Relating to the State of Emergency at a Total of $1,890.54 
14. Approve Proposal from Chamlin & Associates to Complete the Design Phase and the Construction Phase 

Engineering of the Needed Improvement to the Water Treatment Plant Lime Lagoon Casing and Catwalks 
for a Total Cost Not to Exceed $15,000 

15. Approve Payment to Brightly Solutions in the Amount of $6,831.96 for Asset Essentials Services 
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Alderperson Kirwin made a motion and Alderperson Mietzner seconded to approve the Consent Agenda for 
March 20, 2024, except for tabling #11 An Ordinance Amending Section 74.02 of the City of Wilmington Code 
of Ordinances Regarding the Operation of Golf Carts within the City of Wilmington because the signage is not 
yet installed, City Council meeting as presented     
 
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 6 Kirwin, Mietzner, Jeffries, Vice, Smith, Holmes 
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Knight, Allred 

The motion carried. 
 
MAYOR’S REPORT 
Nothing to report 
 
ORDER OF BUSINESS 
None 
 
REPORTS AND COMMUNICATION FROM CITY OFFICIALS 
City Attorney – Bryan Wellner – No Report      
 
City Administrator – Jeannine Smith – The candidate for the Building Permit Technician has accepted the City’s 
conditional offer. This will be ratified at the April 2nd meeting.    
 
Finance Director – Nancy Gross – No Report  
 
Public Works Director – James Gretencord – No Report 
 
Chief of Police – Adam Zink – Reported that Code Enforcement Officer Joey Crist tendered her resignation 
effective March 28, 2024.   
 
ALDERPERSON COMMENTS 
Alderperson Kirwin – No Comment  
 
Alderperson Vice – No Comment   
 
Alderperson Allred – Absent 
 
Alderperson Holmes – No Comment 
 
Alderperson Jeffries – No Comment   
 
Alderperson Knight – Absent   
 
Alderperson Mietzner – No Comment  
 
Alderperson Smith – Commended all the efforts to keep the Gemini Giant in Wilmington  
 
ADJOURNMENT 
The motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Alderperson Kirwin and seconded by Alderperson Holmes. 
Upon the voice vote, the motion carried. The City of Wilmington City Council's regular meeting on March 20, 
2024, adjourned at 7:25 p.m.  
 
Respectfully submitted, 
     
Joie Ziller, Deputy City Clerk 





















































































































 

Minutes to the City of Wilmington 
Planning and Zoning Commission Meeting   

Wilmington City Hall 
1165 South Water Street 

Thursday, March 7, 2024 at 5:00 PM 
   
Call to Order 
The March 7, 2024 meeting of the Wilmington Planning & Zoning Commission was called to order 
at 5:00 p.m. by Chairperson Humphries 
 
Roll Call 
Upon Roll Call by the Clerk the following members answered “Here” or “Present”: 
 
Commissioners Present Humphries, Tyrner, Clennon, Longest, Francis 
  
Commissioner Absent Smith, Studer  
 
Quorum 
There being a sufficient number of members of the corporate authorities in attendance to 
constitute a quorum, the meeting was declared in order. 
 
Other Officials in Attendance 
Also, in attendance were City Administrator Jeannine Smith, Mayor Ben Dietz and Deputy City 
Clerk Joie Ziller  
 
Approve the Previous Meeting Minutes     
Commissioner Clennon made a motion and Commissioner Tryner seconded to approve the 
February 1, 2024 meeting minutes and have them placed on file 
      
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 5 Clennon, Tryner, Longest, Francis, Humphries   
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Smith, Studer 

Motion passed.  
 
Public Hearing to Consider Request by LCC Telecom Services, acting on behalf of VB BTS 
II, LLC requesting to construct a new 199-foot monopole wireless communication tower 
with support equipment. The tower will be built in a 54-foot by 30-foot fenced lease area 
on property located at 29745 Elion Boulevard, Wilmington, IL 60481 
Commissioner Longest made a motion and Commissioner Francis seconded to open the public 
hearing at 5:03 PM  
      
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 5 Longest, Francis, Tryner, Clennon, Humphries   
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Smith, Studer 

Motion passed.  
 
Deputy Clerk Ziller verified that the public hearing notice was published on February 21, 2024, a 
sign was posted at the subject property on January 12, 2024, and notifications were sent via 
USPS Certified Mail to all adjacent property owners within 250 feet of said property on January 
12, 2024.    



 

City Administrator Smith summarized the staff report which was also included in the agenda 
packet. The petitioner is requesting a conditional use to allow for a 190’ antenna support structure 
with a 9’ tall lightning rod totaling 199’. This structure will be built on property which is owned by 
the Wilmington Fire Protection District located on Elion Boulevard which is home to WFPD Station 
#2. City Administrator Smith stated that it would be beneficial for the City as well as the petitioner 
to ensure with ComEd that there is adequate power supply onsite for the project as well as 
reserving municipal colocation space on the proposed structure.   
 
Deputy City Clerk Ziller administered the oath to Julie Baniquad and Tim Zlomie     
 
Julie Baniquad introduced herself to the Commission and explained the proposed project to 
construct a 199’ wireless communication tower on behalf of VB BTS II, LLC, AT&T, and the 
Wilmington Fire Protection District.     
 
Tim Zlomie, Chief of the Wilmington Fire Protection District shared the benefits this proposed 
communication tower will have for the Fire Department.   
 
No additional public comments were made.  
 
Commissioner Tryner made a motion and Commissioner Francis seconded to close the public 
hearing at 5:34 PM  
      
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 5 Tryner, Francis, Clennon, Longest, Humphries   
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Smith, Studer 

Motion passed.  
 
Commissioner Clennon made a motion and Commissioner Longest seconded to approve the 
request by petitioner LLC Telecom Services, acting on behalf of VB BTS II, LLC, and recommend 
to the City Council to authorize the construction of a new 199-foot monopole wireless 
communication tower with support equipment at 29745 Elion Boulevard in Wilmington, IL 
conditioned on verification of common electrical path to the tower and municipal colocation space, 
space and height to be determined     
 
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 5 Clennon, Longest, Tryner, Francis, Humphries   
NAYS: 0  
ABSENT: 2 Smith, Studer 

Motion passed.  
 
Public Comment  
No public comments were made.  
 
Discussion – Thomas Outsen’s Request to Rezone Two Properties from R1 to B3 
City Administrator Smith briefed the Commission on a conversation she had with Mr. Outsen 
regarding rezoning his property, currently vacant, located at the corner of RT 53 and West River 
Road. The Commission understands the potential change in zoning and when Mr. Outsen is ready 
to make that step, they look forward to hearing about his plan.     
 
 
 



 

Other Business – Discussion on 150.120 Designation of Historic Landmarks 
Mayor Dietz informed the Commission that he would like the Commission to consider overseeing 
the historical landmarks designations rather than having to form an entirely different committee. 
After some discussion, the Commission was agreeable but only if a report, directly related to said 
designation, was provided by a professional source and that source also be present at said 
meeting.   
 
Adjournment 
A motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Commissioner Tryner and seconded by 
Commissioner Francis. Upon voice vote, the motion was carried. The Wilmington Planning & 
Zoning meeting held on March 7, 2024, adjourned at 6:17 p.m. 
  
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
      
Joie Ziller 
Deputy City Clerk   



Enclosure

CJM/am

Based on the proposals received, we recommend the project be awarded

to the low, responsive, responsible bidder, Hoerr Construction, Inc. in

the amount of  $652,215.00 .

Project # 66449.01

Insituform Technologies, LLC $783,494.00

Visu Sewer of IL, LLC $796,970.00

Hoerr Construction, Inc. $652,215.00

1165 South Water Street

Wilmington, IL  60481

FROM: Casey J. McCollom

SUBJECT: City of Wilmington

Kankakee Street Sanitary

Sewer Lining

Bids were received and were publicly opened and read today for the

Kankakee Street Sanitary Sewer Lining. All bids received met the intent

of the proposal documents and were in order; the bid results are as

follows:

BIDDER AMOUNT

City of Wilmington

MEMORANDUM

DATE: March 22, 2024

TO: Mayor Ben Dietz

Ottawa Office
218 West Lafayette Street ● Ottawa, IL 61350

Phone 815.434.7225 ● Fax 815.434.2831
ottawa@chamlin.com

Peru Office
4152 Progress Boulevard ● Peru, IL 61354
Phone 815.223.3344 ● Fax 815.223.3348

peru@chamlin.com

221 West Washington Street ● Morris, IL 60450

Phone 815.942.1402 ● morris@chamlin.com  
Professional Design Firm License #184-001717

www.chamlin.com



Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid 

Security

Acknowledge 

Addenda

Comments

Hoerr Construction, Inc.

1416 County Road 200 N

Goodfield, IL 61742

$652,215.00 Bid Bond Yes

Insituform Technologies, LLC

1334 Enterprise Dr.

Romeoville, IL 60446

$783,494.00 Bid Bond Yes

Visu Sewer 

9014 Thomas Ave. 

Bridgeview, IL 60

$796,970.00 Bid Bond Yes

Inliner Solutions, LLC

5031 W. 66th St. 

Bedford Park, IL 60638

No Bid

John Burns Construction Company

760 W. Jackson St. 

Morris, IL 60450

No Bid

Michels Trenchless, Inc.

817 Main Street

PO Box 128

Brownsville, WI 53006

No Bid

National Power Rodding Corp. 

2500 W. Arthington St.

Chicago, IL 60612

No Bid

Performance Pipelining

1551 W. Norris Dr.

Ottawa, IL 61350

No Bid

CITY OF WILMINGTON

KANKAKEE STREET SANITARY

SEWER LINING

BID TABULATION

Project No. 66449.01 

10:00AM, Friday, March 22, 2024



BID LETTING: City of Wilmington

Kankakee Street Sanitary

Sewer Lining

10:00AM, Friday, March 22, 2024

NO. QTY UNIT ITEM UNIT 

PRICE   

AMOUNT   UNIT PRICE    AMOUNT     UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

1 1135 LF Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), 8" $42.00 $47,670.00 $39.00 $44,265.00 $39.50 $44,832.50
2 1275 LF Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), 12" $70.60 $90,015.00 $44.00 $56,100.00 $52.50 $66,937.50
3 685 LF Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), 15" $86.00 $58,910.00 $63.00 $43,155.00 $83.50 $57,197.50
4 345 LF Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), 18" $134.35 $46,350.75 $108.00 $37,260.00 $154.50 $53,302.50
5 1925 LF Cured in Place Pipe (CIPP), 24" $128.00 $246,400.00 $112.00 $215,600.00 $163.00 $313,775.00
6 110 EA Reinstatement of Branch Connections $85.00 $9,350.00 $100.00 $11,000.00 $100.00 $11,000.00
7 5365 LF Sewer Cleaning, Standard Grade $6.05 $32,458.25 $3.00 $16,095.00 $8.00 $42,920.00
8 5365 LF Televised Inspection, Sewers $1.00 $5,365.00 $1.00 $5,365.00 $2.00 $10,730.00
9 10 EA Manhole Sewer Separation $7,260.00 $72,600.00 $8,350.00 $83,500.00 $7,465.00 $74,650.00

10 100 FT Sanitary Sewer Point Repairs $995.00 $99,500.00 $990.00 $99,000.00 $846.00 $84,600.00
11 75 FT Manhole Rehabilitation $825.00 $61,875.00 $345.00 $25,875.00 $327.00 $24,525.00
12 250 CY Trench Backfill $52.00 $13,000.00 $60.00 $15,000.00 $50.00 $12,500.00

TOTAL $783,494.00 $652,215.00 $796,970.00

Visu Sewer 

9014 Thomas Ave. 

Bridgeview, IL 60

BIDDER & ADDRESS Insituform Technologies, LLC

1334 Enterprise Dr.

Romeoville, IL 60446

Hoerr Construction, Inc.

1416 County Road 200 N

Goodfield, IL 61742

Bid Bond Bid BondBID DEPOSIT Bid Bond
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA Yes Yes Yes



 

  MEMO 
 
Date: April 2, 2024 
 
To: Honorable Mayor Dietz and City Council Members 
 
From:  James Gretencord, Director of Public Works 
 
Cc:  Jeannine Smith, City Administrator 
  Nancy Gross, Finance Director 
   
Re: Residential Water Meter Purchase 
              
 
 
Budget Impact:  $33,921 Line Item 17-00-6620 Maintenance Water Meters- Capital 
 
Request: Approve the purchase for 100 residential water meters with accessories. 
 
Discussion: Our inventory of 1” residential water meters is below 40 units. There is currently a 

four-week lead time to get new meters — therefore we are requesting the approval to 
purchase 100 1” meters with accessories to keep our meter replacement program 
operating. We have received a quote from Utility Pipe Sales for the needed items at a 
cost of $33,921. This is a budgeted request.  

 
Motion: Approve the purchase of residential water meters from Utility Pipe Sales for a 

total cost of $33,921. 
 
 
 

Thank you in advance for your consideration of this request. 
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