
City of Wilmington 
1165 South Water Street 

Wilmington, IL 60481 

Agenda 
Regular City Council Meeting 

Wilmington City Hall 
Council Chambers 

June 21, 2022 
7:00 p.m. 

In Person & Via Zoom 
join by video at: 

https://us02web.zoom.us/i/82577799320?pwd=OWFTeXRNcWZicjFWTk01ZEYxbmVzZz09   
join by phone at: 
1-312-626-6799

Meeting ID: 825 7779 9320 / Passcode: 492363 
IN ACCORDANCE WITH PUBLIC ACT 101-0640, 5 ILCS 120/7(e), THIS CITY COUNCIL MEETING WILL BE HELD 
IN-PERSON AND REMOTELY BASED ON THE GUBERNATORIAL DISASTER DECLARATION AND THE MAYOR 
OF THE CITY OF WILMINGTON DETERMINING THAT A FULL IN-PERSON MEETING IS NOT PRACTICAL OR 
PRUDENT. MEMBERS OF THE GENERAL PUBLIC WILL BE ABLE TO VIEW AND PARTICIPATE IN THE 
MEETINGS REMOTELY AS WELL. 

1. Call to Order by Mayor Dietz

2. Pledge of Allegiance

3. Roll Call by City Clerk Kevin Kirwin 
Dennis Vice 
Leslie Allred 
Todd Holmes 

Ryan Jeffries 
Ryan Knight 
Jonathan Mietzner 
Thomas Smith 

4. Approval of the Previous City Council Meeting Minutes

5. Mayor's Report
Approve Mayoral Appointment of Bob Bolser to the Police Pension Board 
Swearing of Bob Bolser

6. Public Comment (State your full name clearly; limit 3 minutes each per Ordinance 19-06-18-01)

7. Planning & Zoning Commission
The next meeting is scheduled for July 14, 2022 at 5:00 pm.

8. Committee of the Whole

A. Police & ESDA
Co-Chairs - Jonathan Mietzner and Leslie Allred 



1. Approve the purchase of the GMC Sierra 1500 4WD Crew Cab as proposed from
Community GMC, Inc. for ESDA

B. Ordinance & License
Co-Chairs - Kevin Kirwin and Ryan Knight

1. Approve Ordinance No. 22-06-21-01, An Ordinance An Amended Ordinance to 
Encourage New Residential Construction and Economic Growth for the Citizens & City of 
Wilmington

2. Approve Ordinance No. 22-06-21-02, An Ordinance Amending the Wilmington Code of 
Ordinances as it Pertains Title XV-Land Usage

C. Buildings, Grounds, Parks, Health & Safety
Co-Chairs - Ryan Jeffries and Thomas Smith

D. Water, Sewer, Streets & Alleys
Co-Chairs - Todd Holmes and Dennis Vice

1. Approve the purchase of the 2022 Ford Transit Cut-Away as proposed from Kunes 
Auto Group for the Water Meter Department

2. Approve the purchase of water meters and hardware as proposed from Utility Pipe 
Sales, Inc

3. Approve the contract with Geosyntec Consultants to develop a Nutrient Assessment 
Reduction Plan (NARP) workplan

E. Personnel & Collective Bargaining
Co-Chairs - Jonathan Mietzner and Todd Holmes

1. Approve Administration to seek and hire a part-time Code Enforcement Officer

F. Finance, Administration & Land Acquisition Committee
Co-Chairs - Kevin Kirwin and Ryan Jeffries

1. Approve the Accounting Reports as Presented by the Finance Director

2. Ratify the Approval and Execution by the City Administrator for the Memorandum of 
Understanding Agreement between the Wilmington Coalition for a Healthy 
Community and the City of Wilmington

3. Ratify the Approval and Execution by the City Administrator for the Linkage 
Agreement/Letter of Agreement with Wilmington Coalition for a Healthy Community

9. Attorney & Staff Reports
10. Adjournment

The next regular City Council meeting is scheduled for July 5, 2022 at 7 PM 



1 

Minutes of the Regular Meeting of the 
Wilmington City Council 

Wilmington City Hall 
1165 South Water Street 

June 7, 2022 

Call to Order 
The Regular Meeting of the Wilmington City Council on June 7, 2022 was called to order at 7:00 
p.m. by Pro Tem Mayor Alderman Leslie Allred in the Council Chamber of the Wilmington City
Hall.

Roll Call  
Upon Roll Call by the Clerk the following members of the corporate authorities answered “Here” 
or “Present”: 

Aldermen Present Kirwin, Jeffries, Vice, Knight, Allred, Mietzner, Holmes, Smith 

Quorum 
There being a sufficient number of members of the corporate authorities in attendance to 
constitute a quorum, the meeting was declared in order 

Other Officials in Attendance 
Also, in attendance were City Administrator Jeannine Smith, Chief Joe Mitchell, Public Works 
Director James Gretencord, City Attorney Bryan Wellner, and Deputy City Clerk Joie Ziller 

Approval of the Previous Regular City Council Meeting  
Alderman Mietzner made a motion and Alderman Jeffries seconded to approve the May 17, 2022 
meeting minutes and have them placed on file 

Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Kirwin, Holmes, Jeffries, Knight, Vice, Allred, Mietzner, Smith 
NAYS: 0  

The motion carried. 

Mayor’s Report 
Nothing to report at this time. 

Public Comment  
Public Comment 1 – Christopher Reed stated that he would like to set up a disc golf course on 
the South Island Park, hold weekly leagues and events. 

Public Comment 2 – Paula Ekstrom representing the Wilmington Coalition for Healthy Community 
explained the need for the City to be the fiduciary agent on a federal grant the Coalition is applying 
for. The Sober Truth on Preventing Underage Drinking Act Grant program is to prevent and reduce 
alcohol use among youth and young adults ages 12-20 in community. 

Public Comment 3 – Alderman Vice expressed his concerns with the condition of the property located 
at 103 McIntyre Street. 

Planning & Zoning Commission 
The next meeting is scheduled for July 12, 2022 at 5:00 pm 



 

2 
 

Committee of the Whole Reports 
 

A. Police & ESDA 
Co-Chairs – Jonathan Mietzner and Leslie Allred 

   
Nothing at this time   

 
B. Ordinance & License 

Co-Chairs – Kevin Kirwin and Ryan Knight 
 
Alderman Kirwin made a motion and Alderman Jeffries seconded to approve Ordinance 
No. 22-06-07-01 – An Ordinance Declaring as Surplus Certain Equipment and Authorizing 
the Chief of Police to Dispose of Said Equipment in a Manner in the Best Interest of the 
City of Wilmington 
 

 Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Mietzner, Allred, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  

 The motion carried. 
  

C. Buildings, Grounds, Parks, Health & Safety 
Co-Chairs – Ryan Jeffries and Thomas Smith  

 
 Nothing at this time 
 

D. Water, Sewer, Streets & Alleys 
Co-Chairs – Todd Holmes and Dennis Vice 
 

 Nothing at this time 
 

E. Personnel & Collective Bargaining 
Co-Chairs – Jonathan Mietzner and Todd Holmes 

  
 Nothing at this time 

 
F. Finance, Administration & Land Acquisition Committee 

Co-Chairs – Kevin Kirwin and Ryan Jeffries 
 
Alderman Jeffries made a motion and Alderman Knight seconded to approve the Financial 
Reports and Accounts Payable Report in the Amount of $310,995.26 as presented by the 
Finance Director   
  

 Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred, Mietzner, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  

 The motion carried. 
  

Alderman Jeffries made a motion and Alderman Smith seconded to approve and execute 
the Laser Encore Contract for the Catfish Days Festival in an amount not to exceed $6,500  

  
 Upon roll call, the vote was: 

AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred, Mietzner, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  



 

3 
 

 The motion carried. 
 

Alderman Kirwin made a motion and Alderman Jeffries seconded to approve IDOT 
Engineering Services Agreement for Forked Creek Bridge Project (BLR 05530)  

  
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred, Mietzner, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  

 The motion carried. 
 

Alderman Kirwin made a motion and Alderman Knight seconded to approve IDOT Local 
Public Agency Amendment #2 (BLR 05311) for Phase I Engineering in the amount of 
$237,655 for the Forked Creek Bridge Project 
  
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred, Mietzner, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  

 The motion carried. 
 

Alderman Kirwin made a motion and Alderman Mietzner seconded to approve the cost, 
not to exceed $10,000, for Kubinski Diving Industries, LLC to clean the intakes at the 
Water Treatment Plant 
  
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred, Mietzner, Kirwin, Smith, Holmes  
NAYS: 0  

 The motion carried. 
 
Attorney & Staff Reports 
Administrator Smith stated that the Wilmington Park District will be holding its first Farmers Market 
of the season on June 16th.   
 
Executive Session 
Alderman Mietzner made a motion and Alderman Knight seconded to go into Executive Session 
at 7:35 PM to discuss the Appointment, Employment, Dismissal, Compensation, Discipline and 
Performance of an Employee of the City of Wilmington [ILCS 120/2(c)(1)], Collective negotiating 
matters between the City of Wilmington (public body) and its employees [ILCS 120/2(c)(2)], 
Matters of Land Acquisition [ILCS 2(c)(5) and 2(c)(6)], Probable or Imminent Litigation and 
Pending Litigation [ILCS 2(c)(11)]    
 
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Kirwin, Holmes, Smith, Mietzner, Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred 
NAYS: 0  

The motion carried.  
 
Alderman Mietzner made a motion and Alderman Knight seconded to close Executive Session at 
7:44 PM 
 
Upon roll call, the vote was: 
AYES: 8 Kirwin, Holmes, Smith, Mietzner, Vice, Knight, Jeffries, Allred 
NAYS: 0  



 

4 
 

The motion carried.  
 
Action Taken Following Executive Session 
 
No action taken.  
 
Adjournment 
Motion to adjourn the meeting made by Alderman Mietzner and seconded by Alderman Knight. 
Upon the voice vote, the motion carried. The Regular Meeting of the City of Wilmington City 
Council held on June 7, 2022 adjourned at 7:45 p.m.  
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
     
Joie Ziller, Deputy City Clerk 



























ORDINANCE NO. 22-06-21-01 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND AN ORDINANCE  
TO ENCOURAGE NEW RESIDENTIAL CONSTRUCTION  

AND ECONOMIC GROWTH FOR THE CITIZENS AND CITY OF WILMINGTON 
   
   
            WHEREAS, there are currently approximately 130 vacant residentially zoned platted lots 
in the City of Wilmington; and  
 

WHEREAS, the Governing Body of the City of Wilmington has determined that the 
current economic climate is unfavorable to, and hindering the completion of, construction on these 
currently platted residential lots in the City of Wilmington; and  
  
            WHEREAS, in order to obtain a building permit to commence construction on any of these 
lots one must first pay various impact and connection fees to the City; and    
 
            WHEREAS, these impact and connection fees can easily exceed $12,000 or more and 
oftentimes cause the construction of a residential structure to be problematical or cost prohibitive; 
and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Governing Body of the City of Wilmington believes that waiving the 
various impact and connection fees for the next ten (10) residential building permits for currently 
platted lots in the City of Wilmington would be a catalyst for residential construction and economic 
growth for the City of Wilmington and its citizens.   
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF WILMINGTON, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS FOLLOWS:  
    
SECTION 1: WAIVER OF IMPACT FEES 
   
              That the City of Wilmington hereby waives the collection of all impact fees set forth in 
Chapters 152.60, 152.61, and 160, for the next ten (10) residential building permits for currently 
existing residentially zoned lots in the City of Wilmington. 
 
SECTION 2: WAIVER OF CONNECTION FEES 
 

That the City of Wilmington hereby waives the collection of all connection fees, but not 
meter costs, for the next ten (10) residential building permits for currently existing residentially 
zoned platted lots in the City of Wilmington.  
 
SECTION 3: ELIGIBILITY    
 

• This incentive is valid until ten residential permit applications are completed. 
• All ad valorem property taxes and special assessments, if any, on the property for which 

the application is submitted may not be delinquent. If any ad valorem property taxes and 
any special assessments are delinquent, the property will not be eligible for the program 



until such time as all taxes and special assessments due and owing are paid in full and proof 
thereof of provided to the City of Wilmington.  

• The minimum construction valuation must be no less than $100,000 as determined and 
approved on the building permit application. 

• Only single-family residential structures are eligible for the program. 
• Construction must be completed within 180 days.  

 
SECTION 4: REPEAL OR AMENDMENT 
 

Ordinance No. 18-11-20-03, adopted by the Governing Body on November 20, 2022, 2014, 
is hereby repealed. This program may, at any time after adoption, be amended supplemented, or 
repealed by a majority vote of the Governing Body.    
 
SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 
 
  If any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, sentence or provision of this Ordinance shall 
be adjudged by any Court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, such judgment shall not affect, 
impair, invalidate or nullify the remainder thereof, which remainder shall remain and continue in full 
force and effect. 
 
SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE 
 
 This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon its passage and approval in the manner 
required by law. 
 
 PASSED this 21st day of June 2022 with _____ members voting aye, _____ members 
voting nay, the Mayor voting _____, with _____ members abstaining or passing and said vote 
being: 
 

Kevin Kirwin   Ryan Jeffries  
Dennis Vice    Ryan Knight  
Leslie Allred   Jonathan Mietzner  
Todd Holmes    Thomas Smith   

 
Approved this 21st day of June 2022    
     

      
Ben Dietz, Mayor 

 
 
 
Attest: 
 

 
Joie Ziller, Deputy City Clerk 

 



 

MEMO 
 
Date:  June 17, 2022 
 
To: Honorable Mayor Dietz and City Council Members 
 
From:  Jeannine Smith, City Administrator 

 
Cc:  Joie Ziller, Deputy Clerk 
  Jayson Walinski, Building Inspector 
 
Re: Motion to Adopt Ordinance No. 22-06-21-02, An Ordinance Amending the 

Wilmington Code of Ordinances as it Pertains to Title XV – Land Usage 
 
              
 
Budget Impact:  $4,500 expenditure for professional fees budgeted 
 
History: In November of 2021, the City engaged B&F Construction Code Services (“B&F”) to 
assist the Building Department with a host of services including commercial plan review and 
inspections and ordinance development as they relate to land use (construction/building).  
Land use codes are adopted by the city for the purpose of providing minimum standards for the 
protection of life, limb, health, property, environment and for the safety and welfare of the 
consumer, general public and the owners and occupants of buildings and structures.  The City’s 
existing land use codes are outdated and do not currently provide the City with a means by 
which to enforce property maintenance standards. 
 
Staff began working with B&F on this code amendment in February of this year.  We requested 
B&F to research Channahon, Bourbonnais, Bradley, and Braidwood to ensure that we remain 
comparable to area communities.  The City review team consisted of the Building Inspector, 
Fire Chief Zlomie, the Deputy Clerk and myself.  Since B&F also performs reviews for the Fire 
Department, the process was comprehensive as well as expeditious.  The draft amendment was 
presented to the City Council at its Committee of the Whole Meeting in April.  Public comment 
was entertained at that time.  Please note that staff does not recommend changing the fees at 
this time as a separate project will be started in the coming months to analyze the building fee 
structure and (if needed) will make a recommendation to the City Council for adoption of a 
building fee amendment at a future date. 
 
Staff Analysis:  The International Code Council (“ICC”) regularly amends codes to maintain the 
highest standards in the construction industry.  “The International Code Council is the leading 
global source of model codes and standards and building safety solutions that include product 



evaluation, accreditation, technology, training, and certification. The Code Council's codes, 
standards, and solutions are used to ensure safe, affordable, and sustainable communities and 
buildings worldwide.”  (source:  https://www.iccsafe.org/about/who-we-are/)   
 
The City currently enforces the ICC 2006 Codes which are 16 years old.  As you can imagine, 
much has changed in the past 16 years.  The ICC Code books which contain all of their 
regulations are in many volumes of books used by staff as reference.  As a matter of 
practicality, since the ordinance before you effectually replaces these books as well as certain 
code chapters under the Land Use section of the Municipal Code I will focus on the highlights -  
 

• The International Building Code now requires sprinkler systems on all NEW structures 
except accessory structures 1,500 sf or less and Unheated, Unoccupied structures less 
than 5,000 square feet of non-combustible construction used for non-hazardous storage 

• The 2022 International Property Maintenance Code is added 

• The new National Electric Code now requires arc fault breakers, permits Romex cabling 
in residential construction, and requires an exterior emergency disconnect for all new 
construction and new services. 

• Construction or activities related to construction shall be permitted only during the 
following times: 

Weekdays  7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 
Saturdays  8:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 
Sundays and holidays 9:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m.  

• Painting of Masonry. Existing exterior building masonry, brick, stone or similar shall not 
be painted without written approval from the building official. 

• Siding & Roofing Repair and Replacement. Removal of dissimilar siding and roofing 
materials is required for siding replacement and repairs. Roofing, siding, soffit, and 
fascia material shall match throughout the entire structure.  Special designs shall be 
approved in writing by the city prior to installation. Where 50% or more of a roof or 
siding is to be replaced, the entirety of the roof or siding shall be replaced as well unless 
approved otherwise in writing. 

• Mobile homes and modular construction is hereby prohibited. Structures whose work 
cannot be inspected prior to concealment is hereby prohibited.  

• The extension time on building permits is reduced from 360 days to 180 days 

• Water and Sewer lines are now required to be installed by a licensed plumber 
 
I understand this is a lot of information to absorb, so please do not hesitate to reach out to me 
or Inspector Walinski with any questions you may have. 
 
Motion:    At this time, staff respectfully requests and recommends a motion adopting: 
 

➢ Ordinance No. 22-06-21-02, An Ordinance Amending the Wilmington Code of 
Ordinances as it Pertains to Title XV – Land Usage 

 
Thank you in advance for your consideration of this request.  Please do not hesitate to reach 
out to me with questions. 

https://www.iccsafe.org/about/who-we-are/


 
Page 1 of 18 

ORDINANCE NO. 22-06-21-02 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE WILMINGTON CODE OF ORDINANCES AS IT 

PERTAINS TITLE XV – LAND USAGE 

 NOW THEREFORE. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 

THE CITY OF WILMINGTON, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS: 

SECTION 1:  CHAPTERS REPEALED  
  
 Chapter 154 - Electrical Wiring Code and Chapter 158 - Swimming Pools are hereby 

repealed in its entirety from Title XV of the City of Wilmington Code of Ordinances.  

SECTION 2:  AMENDMENT TO TITLE XV - LAND USAGE 
 

That Title XV is hereby amended to reorganize its chapters as follows:  
 
Title XV – Land Usage 
Chapter 150 – Zoning Ordinance 
Chapter 151 – Planning Commission – Comprehensive Plan 
Chapter 152 – Land Subdivision 
Chapter 153 – Updated Official Plan and Map* 
Chapter 154 – Building Code 
Chapter 155 – Plumbing Code 
Chapter 156 – Flood Hazard Areas 
Chapter 157 – Mobile Home Parks 
Chapter 158 – Dedication of School Sites or In-Lieu Payments 
Chapter 159 – Construction of Facilities in Public Rights-Of-Way 
Chapter 160 – Construction Standards and Specifications 
Chapter 161 – Small Wireless Facilities 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
[INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK] 



 
Page 2 of 18 

SECTION 3:  BUILDING CODE AMENDED  
 

That Chapter 154 – Building Code is hereby amended to state in its entirety the 

following: 

Chapter 154 BUILDING CODE

154.01 Adoption of building code. 

(A) Building Code. There is adopted by the city for the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the 
construction, alteration, removal, demolition, equipment, use and occupancy, and location and maintenance 
of buildings and structures, including permits and penalties, the International Building Code, current edition 
as amended to date hereof, save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. 
At least one copy has been and is now filed in the office of the building inspector and the same is hereby 
adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From and after the effective date of this 
section, the provisions thereof shall be controlling in the construction of all buildings and structures therein 
contained within the corporate limits of the city.  

There are adopted by the city for the purpose of providing minimum standards for the protection of life, 
limb, health, property, environment and for the safety and welfare of the consumer, general public and the owners 
and occupants of buildings and structures, including permits and penalties, the following additional codes, save 
and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended: 2021 ICC International Building Code , 
2020 National Electrical Code, 2021 International Existing Building Code, 2021 International Fire Code, 2021 
International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 International Mechanical Code, 2021 International Residential Code, 2021 
International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code,  Illinois Energy 
Conservation Code  (current), Illinois Plumbing Code (current), Illinois Accessibility Code (current). At least one 
copy of each code has been and is now filed in the office of the building inspector and the same is hereby adopted 
and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From and after the effective date of this section, the 
provisions thereof shall be controlling in the construction of all buildings and structures covered by said codes. 

(B) Policy and Procedure. There is adopted by the city for the purpose of establishing minimum standards, rules 
and regulations for the construction, alteration, removal, demolition, equipment, use and occupancy, and 
location and maintenance of buildings and structures, including permits and penalties, policy and 
procedures. These are the amendments, deletions and various information of said code. At least one copy 
has been and is now filed in the office of the building inspector and the same is hereby adopted and 
incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From and after the effective date of this section the 
provisions thereof shall be controlling in the construction of all buildings and structures covered by said 
code.  

(1) Building Construction.  

(a) Monotony. Monotony of design in multiple buildings shall be avoided. Variation of detail, form, 
and sitting shall be used to provide visual interest. In multiple buildings, variable sitting or 
individual buildings may be used to prevent a monotonous appearance. Following is the 
Monotony Code for the spacing of attached and detached family homes.  

(2) Identical Models With Identical Elevations. Identical models with identical elevations may be erected 
no more often than every third lot along the frontage; i.e., two dissimilar models must be erected 
between each identical model with identical front elevations. Identical models, regardless of 
elevations, shall not be constructed directly across the street or other right-of-way from the front of 
that model.  



 

 
Page 3 of 18 

(3) Identical Models With Significantly Different Front Elevations. Identical models with significantly 
different front elevations may be erected on every second lot; i.e., a completely different model must 
be erected between identical models with different elevations. Identical models regardless of 
elevations shall not be constructed directly across the street or other right-of-way from the front of 
that model.  

(4) Changes required incorporating at least three (3) of the following features:  

(a) Garage: (i) access—front load, side load; or (ii) door design—double overhead or single doors 
with piers;  

(b) Entry/doorway design;  

(c) Windows locations and design style;  

(d) Reverse the plan;  

(e) Vinyl (not contractor grade), aluminum or wood siding versus brick or stone;  

(f) Roof treatment—hip or gable.  

(5) The following is the Monotony Code for townhome, apartment and condo units: no two neighboring 
buildings shall have identical exterior elevations. Each individual building shall vary from the adjacent 
unit in the same building or neighboring building by incorporating at least three (3) of the following 
features:  

(a) Roof treatment—hip or gable;  

(b) Dormer—location;  

(c) Garage door treatments—double overhead or single doors with piers;  

(d) Garage access—front load vs. side load;  

(e) Windows—box windows, bay windows, arched windows, flush windows, etc.;  

(f) Front access—larger porch with larger overhang vs. smaller stoop with overhang;  

(g) Vinyl (not contractor grade), aluminum or wood siding versus brick or stone.  

(6) Minimum Square Feet. See Section 150.04, Scope of regulations (amended).  

(C) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Building Code.  

(1) Amendments.  

(a) Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 103.1. Insert: Building Department 

(c) Section 101.4.3. Replace “International Plumbing Code” with “Illinois Plumbing Code”; Replace 
“International Private Sewage Disposal Code” with “Illinois Plumbing Code”.  

(d) Section 101.4.6 Replace “International Energy Conservation Code” with “Illinois Energy 
Conservation Code [71 Ill. Admin. Code 600.100 et seq.]. 

(e) Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Modify “Building:” as follows: 

Building: 

1. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the footing 
to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II or IIIA liquids. 
2. Sidewalks and patios not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade, and not over any 
basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route. 
3. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work. 
4. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery. 



 

 
Page 4 of 18 

5. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 24 inches (610 
mm) deep, are not greater than 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) and are installed entirely above ground. 
6. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including service systems. 
7. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-family dwellings. 
8. Window awnings in Group R-3 and U occupancies, supported by an exterior wall that do not project 
more than 54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support. 
9. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1753 
mm) in height. 
(f) Section 105.5 Expiration: Add the following language:  Permits expire after 1 year has passed 

from date of issuance. Permits may be extended at the discretion of the Building Official for an 
additional 180 days at the cost listed on the fee schedule. After the first extension has passed, 
the permit must be renewed at full cost.  

(g)  Revise and add to Section 903.2. Exceptions. Modify as follows: An automatic sprinkler system 
shall not be required in the following: 

1. Exception #1 to remain as is. 

2. Accessory structures less than 1,500 square feet. 

3. Unheated, unoccupied structures of non-combustible construction used for non-
hazardous storage. 

(h) Section 1101.1 Scope. Revise to read: “The provisions of the Illinois Accessibility Code shall 
control the design and construction of facilities for individuals with disabilities.” Delete the 
remainder of Chapter 11. 

(i) Section 1612.3. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(j) Section 1612.3. Insert: January 7, 2003  

(k)  Section 2901.1 Scope. Delete and replace with: “Plumbing for new and existing structures shall 
comply with the Illinois Plumbing Code.”  

(l)  Create and insert section 2901.2 Stormwater Drainage. Stormwater drainage shall comply with 
Chapter 11 of the International Plumbing Code. 

(m) Section 3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher.  Revise first sentence to read: 
“Where elevators are provided in buildings, not less than one elevator shall be provided for fire 
department emergency access to all floors.” 

(n) Adopt appendices C, D, F, G, H, J, K, M, and O 

(2) Deletions. 

(a) 108—Fees, 109—Inspections, 110—Certificate of Occupancy, 112—Board of Appeals, 1809.12--
Timber footings, 2902__Minimum plumbing facilities. 

(b) Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.11 except 903.2.11.2, 903.2.11.4, 903.2.11.5, 903.2.11.6 

(c) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict.  

(D) Amendments and deletions to 2020 National Electrical Code.  

(1) Amendments.  

(a) Create and insert 90.2(A) (7) When rework or rewiring of an existing structure exceeds 50% all 
wiring shall be installed per currently adopted electrical code and amendments. 

(b) Create and insert 210.8(A) (5) Basements, Exception. Sump Pumps, Ejector Pumps, or motor-
driven appliances (i.e., refrigerator/freezer, washer, dryer). All sump pumps, ejector pumps or 
motor-driven appliances served by a simplex receptacle shall not require GFCI protection. 



 

 
Page 5 of 18 

(c) Section 230.50(B)(1) Service-Entrance Cables. Revise to read: “All electrical services shall be rigid 
metal conduit with the exception of the underground portion of services which may be in 
Schedule 80 PVC.” 

(d) Section 230.79(C) One-Family Dwellings. Revise to read: For a new one-family dwelling, the 
service disconnecting means shall have a rating of not less than 200 amperes, 3-wire. 100 
ampere, 3 wire service is the minimum required service for any remodeling of existing residential 
construction with a metallic riser and metallic conduit to panel or a ComEd-approved 
underground service. Provide calculations sheets for new services. 

(e) Section 310.3(B) Conductor Material. Add the following sentence: All electrical wiring on the load 
side of the meter shall be copper.  

(2) Deletions.  

(a) Article 394 Concealed Knob-and-Tube Wiring.  

(b) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict.  

 (E) Amendments and deletions to 2021 International Existing Building Code.  

(1) Amendments.  

(a) Section 101.1 Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 103.1 Insert: Building Department 

(c) Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building: Delete item 1, renumber remaining items. 

 (2) Deletions. All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the 
extent of such conflict.  

(G) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Fire Code.  

(1) Amendments.  

(a) Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 112.4. Insert: See fee schedule. 

 (c) 506.1 Where required: where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because of 
secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or firefighting purposes, 
the fire code official is authorized to require a key box to be installed in an approved location. 
The key box shall be the type and size approved by the Wilmington Fire Protection District and 
shall be placed in or on the structure as to provide unobstructed access for life saving and 
firefighting purposes. The key box shall contain all keys necessary to gain access as required by 
the Wilmington Fire Protection District.  

(d) 506.3 Compliance. The district shall require key boxes in the following instances:  

(I) In all multiple residential occupancies that are locked for security reasons and that have a 
common corridor(s) to the living units.  

(II) In all multiple residential occupancies with 4 or more units, without common corridors, but 
that key is not readily available for life saving or firefighting purposes.  

(III) In all structures which have sprinklers or alarms.  

(IV) In any commercial or industrial structure.  

(V) Any covered or strip mall for entry into any individual space or occupancy.  

(VI) In any gated complex, commercial or residential complex.  



 

 
Page 6 of 18 

Exception: For all existing structures or areas, as required above, compliance is given a one-year 
time period from adoption of this ordinance. Reference: Wilmington Fire Protection District 
Ordinance # 05-06-004 (3/16/06). 

(e)  Section 903.2 Revise to read as follows: “Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler 
systems in new buildings and structures shall be provided throughout all occupancies.” 

 
(f)  Revise and add to Section 903.2 Exceptions. Modify as follows: An automatic sprinkler system 

shall not be required in the following: 

1. Exception #1 to remain as is. 

2. Accessory structures less than 1,500 square feet. 

3. Unheated, unoccupied structures of non-combustible construction used for non-
hazardous storage. 

(g)  Section 1103.5.3. Insert: As determined by the Fire Official. 

(h)  Section 5704.2.9.6.1. Insert: where not permitted by the zoning ordinance. 

(i)  Section 5706.2.4.4. Insert: where not permitted by the zoning ordinance. 

(j)  Section 5806.2. Insert: where not permitted by the zoning ordinance. 

(k)  Section 6104.2. Insert: where not permitted by the zoning ordinance. 

(2) Deletions.  

(a) Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.11 except 903.2.11.2, 903.2.11.4, 903.2.11.5, 903.2.11.6 

(b) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(H) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Residential Code.  

(1) Amendments.  

(a) Section R101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Modify “Building:” as follows: 

Building: 

1. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the bottom of the 
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge. 

2. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work. 

3. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep. 

4. Swings and other playground equipment. 

5. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54 inches (1372 
mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support. 

(c) Section R105.5 Expiration: Add the following language:  Permits expire after 1 year has passed 
from date of issuance. Permits may be extended at the discretion of the Building Official for an 
additional 180 days at the cost listed on the fee schedule. After the first extension has passed, 
the permit must be renewed at full cost.  

(d) Table R301.2 (1) Insert the following data into the table: 

Ground snow load 30 lbs/sq. ft. 



 

 
Page 7 of 18 

Wind design (speed) 115 mph 

Wind design (topographic effects) No 

Seismic design category B 

Subject to damage from (weathering) Severe 

Subject to damage from (frost line depth) 42" below grade 

Subject to damage from (termite) Moderate to heavy 

Winter design temperature -5°F 

Ice barrier underlayment required Yes 

Flood hazards No 

Air freezing index 2,000 

Mean annual temperature 48°F 

Elevation 758 

Latitude 42 

Winter heating 1 

Summer cooling 88° 

Altitude correction factor .98 

Indoor design temperature 72°F 

Design temperature cooling 75°F 

Heating temperature differential (72) 

Cooling temperature differential 15 

Wind velocity heating 15 

Wind velocity cooling 7 1/2 

Coincident wet bulb 74 

Daily range M 

Winter humidity 40 



 

 
Page 8 of 18 

Summer differential 2.25 

 

(e) Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. Modify to read as: “An automatic 
residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in townhouses consisting of more than 4 units.  

(f) Section R313.2 One- and two- family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. Delete this 
section in its entirety.  

(g) Section R402.1 Wood Foundations. Delete this section and replace with: “Wood foundations shall 
be prohibited. Delete all further references to wood foundations.” 

(h) Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3). Delete these figures. 

(i) Section R403.1.1 Minimum size. Revise the first sentence to read: “The minimum width, W, and 
thickness, T, for concrete footings shall be in accordance with Tables R403.1(1) through R403.1(3) 
and Figure R403.1(1) or R403.1.3, as applicable, but not less than 20 inches (305 mm) in width 
and 10 inches (152 mm) in depth.”  

(j) Section R403.1.3.5 Reinforcement. Add the following sentence: “Two #4 rebars shall be installed 
in the center of the concrete footing area and have keyway provided.  

(k) Section R403.1.4.1 Frost protection. Delete exceptions # 1 and # 2 and replace with the following: 
“# 1. Protection of free-standing accessory structures greater than 120 square feet shall not be 
required provided the slab thickness is not less than 4 inches with a minimum of 6 inches X 6 
inches 10#/10# WWF reinforcing with the perimeter of the slab turned down to a minimum of 12 
inches below grade and is reinforced with a minimum of 1 continuous (minimum 12 inch tied 
laps) #4 steel reinforcing bar. A minimum of 4 inches of screened and washed gravel or crushed 
stone shall be under the entire slab. The grade surrounding the building shall a minimum of 6 
inches within the first 10 feet.” Renumber exception # 3 to # 2. 

(l) Section R404.1 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Add the following sentences: 
“Foundation walls shall have at least two #4 rebar at bottom and top of wall. If nine feet or 
higher concrete walls are installed, then use 1-#4 rebar in center of wall. Be damp proofed and 
have insulation installed if placed on the outside as required. Openings for beam pockets in 
foundation walls must be filled with concrete.” 

(m) Adopt Appendices A, B, C, D, F, G, H, J, K, M, and O. 

 (2) Deletions.  

(a) Chapters 25-33. Reference Illinois Plumbing Code adoption with amendments. 

(b) Chapters 34-43. Reference National Electrical Code adoption with amendments. 

(c) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(I) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Property Maintenance Code 

(1) Amendments.  

(a)  Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 103.1. Insert: Police Department 

(c) Section 302.4. Insert: 8 inches 

(d) Section 304.14. Insert: March 1, December 1 

(e) Section 602.3. Insert: September 15, May 15 



 

 
Page 9 of 18 

(f) Section 602.4. Insert: September 15, May 15 

(2) Deletions.  

(a) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(J) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

(1) Amendments.  

(a)  Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 103.1. Insert: Police Department 

(c) Section 113.4. Insert: Ordinance Violation, $750.00 each day a violation exists 

(d) Add Section 301.2 Location. No portion of a private swimming pool outside a building shall be 
located at a distance less than 10 feet from any side or rear property line or building line. No 
private swimming pool shall be constructed in the front yard. Pumps, filters and pool water 
disinfection equipment installations shall be located at a distance not less than eight feet from 
any side property line. No private swimming pool shall be constructed within five feet of a septic 
absorption field. No private swimming pool shall be constructed within four feet of a fence. (Ord. 
09-10-20-03, passed 10-20-09) 

(2) Deletions.  

(a) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(K) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Mechanical Code 

(1) Amendments.  

(a)  Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 103.1. Insert: Police Department 

(c) Section 115.4. Insert: Ordinance Violation, $750.00 each day a violation exists 

(2) Deletions.  

(a) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(L) Amendments and Deletions to 2021 International Fuel Gas Code 

(1) Amendments.  

(a)  Section 101.1. Insert: City of Wilmington 

(b) Section 115.4. Insert: Ordinance Violation, $750.00 each day a violation exists 

(2) Deletions.  

(a) All sections or parts of sections in conflict with any amendment shall be deleted to the extent of 
such conflict. 

(M) The City acknowledges and affirms that the Illinois energy efficient building act, 20 ILCS 3125/1 et seq., and the 
Illinois Energy Conservation Code adopted thereunder, 71 Ill. Admin. Code 600.100 et seq., apply within the city. 
The Illinois Energy Conservation Code is hereby adopted and incorporated as if fully set forth herein. 

(N) The provisions of the Illinois Accessibility Code (71 Ill. Adm. Code 400) shall control the design and construction 
of facilities for accessibility for individuals with disabilities. 



 

 
Page 10 of 18 

(Ord. 651, passed 5-2-72; Am. Ord. 1056, passed 4-18-89; Am. Ord. 1072, passed 9-26-89; Am. Ord. 1480, passed 
1-7-03; Am. Ord. 1646, passed 10-19-04; Am. Ord. 05-10-18-02, passed 10-18-05; Am. Ord. 06-08-15-01, passed 8-
18-06; Am. Ord. 07-11-06-05, passed 11-6-07; Am. Ord. No. 18-03-21-01, § 1, passed 3-21-18) 

154.02 Definitions. 

For purposes of this chapter, the following words and phrases shall have the following meanings ascribed to 
them respectively.  

(A) "Municipality." The city of Wilmington, Illinois. 

(B) "Corporation counsel." The attorney for the city of Wilmington.  

(Ord. 651, passed 5-2-72) 

154.03 Fees. 

(A) No permit, as required by the building code, shall be issued until the fee prescribed in this chapter shall have 
been paid; nor shall an amendment to a permit be approved until the additional fee, if any, due to an 
increase in the estimated cost of the building or structure shall have been paid.  

(B) For a permit for the construction, repair, or alteration of a residential building or structure, the fee shall be at 
the rate of $25 per $3,000 of the estimated cost of construction. No fee shall be required when the 
estimated cost does not exceed $200.  

(1) A $50 administration fee per permit shall be processed.  

(2) For a permit for the construction, repair, alteration of a commercial and/or industrial building or 
structure, the fee shall be a flat rate of one percent of the cost of construction.  

(C) For a permit for the demolition of a residential type building or structure, the fee shall be $50. For a permit 
for the demolition of a commercial or industrial type building or structure, the fee shall be $100.  

(D) (Reserved).  

(E) The term "estimated cost," as used in this section, means the value as established by "ICC Evaluation as 
published," including all services, labor, materials and use of scaffolding and other appliances or devices 
entering into and necessary to the prosecution and completion of the work ready for occupancy.  

(F) Any person, firm or corporation who commences such construction or alteration of a structure or building, or 
who occupies a building or structure, without first having obtained a permit, as required by this code, shall 
pay, as a permit fee, double the fee that otherwise would have been payable had a permit been obtained 
prior to the commencement of construction or alteration of the structure or building.  

(G) For all construction or alterations of structures or buildings that have been made before the adoption of this 
ordinance and without having obtained a permit, the person that commenced the work shall have 90 days 
after the adoption of this ordinance to obtain the necessary permit at the normal fee amount. After the said 
90 days the permit fee for said completed work shall be double the fee that otherwise would have been 
payable had a permit been obtained prior to the commencement of construction or alteration of the 
structure or building.  

(Ord. 651, passed 5-2-72; Am. Ord. 1059, passed 5-2-89; Am. Ord. 1088, passed 3-6-90; Am. Ord. 1094, passed 4-
17-90; Ord. 1101, passed 6-19-90; Am. Ord. 1395, passed 12-18-01; Ord. 1545, passed 4-1-03; Am. Ord. 06-04-04-
02, passed 4-4-06; Am. Ord. 07-11-06-05, passed 11-6-07; Am. Ord. No. 11-01-04-03, § 1, passed 1-4-11) Penalty, 
see Section 154.99 



 

 
Page 11 of 18 

154.03.1 Inspection fees. 

(A) There will be a $50 inspection fee for each of the following inspections:  

(1) Water and sewer tap;  

(2) Footing;  

(3) Foundation wall;  

(4) Electric service.  

These fees shall be processed with the building permit as applicable and collected at the same time as the 
permit is processed.  

(B) There will be a $60 inspection fee for each of the following inspections:  

(1) Plumbing underground;  

(2) Plumbing rough;  

(3) Plumbing final.  

These fees shall be processed with the building permit as applicable and collected at the same time as the 
permit is processed.  

(C) There will be a $75 fee for each reinspection performed and shall be collected before the reinspection is 
performed.  

(D) No work or any installation shall be covered before the underground or rough-in inspection is performed. All 
violations will be corrected before any work or any installation is buried, or covered over.  

(E) When the building inspector is not available for an inspection or inspections an authorized city official shall 
contact the part-time or fill-in inspector. The part-time or fill-in inspector shall be authorized by the council 
and compensated upon a fee basis per inspection in such amount of $20 per inspection or as set by the 
council, but the amount is not to exceed 50% of the inspection fee as set by ordinance.  

(Ord. 1405, passed 1-15-02; Am. Ord. 1647, passed 10-19-04; Am. Ord. 06-08-15-01, passed 8-18-06) 

154.03.2 New industrial and commercial construction inspection fees. 

(A) There will be a $.01 for building, $.01 for plumbing, $.01 for electrical inspection fees per square feet of 
construction area for all initial and subsequent inspections.  

(B) The minimum fee of $60 each inspection shall be received.  

(C) There will be a $75 fee for each failed reinspection performed and shall be collected before the reinspection 
is performed.  

(Ord. 1626, passed 4-20-04; Am. Ord. 06-07-18-02, passed 7-18-06) 

154.04 Building and demolition permits. 

(A) Building permits.  

(1) All building permits issued by the city pursuant to the terms of the building code, adopted by Section 
154.01 of this chapter, for residential occupancy, as defined in Section 11 of the building code, shall be 
valid for a period of one year from the date of issuance. All other building permits for all classes of 
occupancy other than residential occupancy, as defined in Section 11, will be valid for a period of two 
years from the date of issuance.  



 

 
Page 12 of 18 

(2) If the construction, addition or alteration of any building or structure or installation of equipment for 
the operation of a building or a structure is less than 15% completed before the expiration of the 
building permit, then a new application for a permit is required and a new permit fee shall be paid. The 
new fee shall be paid on the basis of the uncompleted work.  

(3) If the construction, addition or alteration of any building or structure or installation of equipment for 
the operation of a building or structure is 50% or more completed at the time the permit expires, then 
the permit may be extended only with the approval of the city council. The extension shall be made at 
no additional charge for a period not to exceed the original term of the permit.  

(4) The building inspector shall determine the percent of the completion under any building permit issued 
by the city and his determination shall be final and binding.  

(5) No building permit for any improvement costing less than $7,000 shall be transmitted to the county of 
Will, state of Illinois, or the local assessor.  

(B) Demolition permits.  

(1) All permits for the removal or demolition of a building or structure issued by the city pursuant to the 
terms of the building code shall be valid for a period of 90 days from the date of issue.  

(2) If the removal or demolition of a building or structure is not completed within the 90 days, then a new 
application for the permit is required and a new permit fee paid.  

(C) This section shall be applicable only to permits issued after March 2, 1976.  

(D) All permit applications shall be filed with the city clerk at least 10 working days before such permit may be 
issued, and no work shall be started or continued without such a permit being issued.  

(Ord. 687, passed 3-2-76; Am. Ord. 1047, passed 12-20-88; Am. Ord. 1089, passed 3-6-90; Am. Ord. 06-04-04-02, 
passed 4-4-06) Penalty, see Section 154.99 

154.05 Saving clause—Pending court cases. 

Nothing in this chapter or in the building code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or 
proceeding now pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, nor any causes of action accrued 
or existing under any act or ordinance repealed hereby. Nor shall any right or remedy of any character be lost, 
impaired, or affected by this chapter.  

(Ord. 651, passed 5-2-72) Penalty, see Section 154.99 

154.06 Fire limits. 

That portion of the city within the following described boundaries is designated as the fire limits of the city. 
All lots or premises abutting on Water Street, on the west side of Main Street and all premises between Water 
Street and Main Street, or between Canal and Jefferson Street.  

('69 Code, § 171.001) 

Cross-reference: Fire department, see Ch. 33; Fire prevention, see Ch. 93.  

154.07 Fire resistance. 

The provisions of this section shall apply to all multifamily structures containing two or more living units; or 
one or more living units in a structure containing any other type of use such as business or industrial. The fire 
resistance rating of structural elements (including walls, floors, and roof) and tenant separation or party walls shall 
be a minimum of two hours. 



 

 
Page 13 of 18 

(Ord. 1051, passed 2-21-89) Penalty, see Section 154.99 

154.08 Driveways, sidewalks and occupancy permits. 

(A) All driveways for any new construction or building permits issued after the effective date of the ordinance 
codified in this section shall be hard surface and shall consist of 5½″ of concrete or the same equivalent of 
blacktop. As stated in subsection (C)(3) below, a cash bond is required if any driveway is not completed prior 
to issuance of an occupancy permit.  

(B) All sidewalks constructed after the effective date of the ordinance codified in this section shall be at least 
5½″ thick at all places where vehicles are to be driven over such sidewalk. A $1,500 deposit payable as part of 
the building permit is required for each building permit granted for a lot with an existing or yet to be 
constructed sidewalk to guarantee replacement if such sidewalk becomes damaged. This deposit shall be 
refunded after issuance of a full occupancy permit that includes construction of all sidewalks and having the 
sidewalk inspected as installed. As stated in subsection (C)(3) below, a cash bond is required if any sidewalk is 
not completed prior to issuance of an occupancy permit.  

(C) Occupancy permits.  

(1) No person shall occupy any building or structure until the building inspector has issued or caused to be 
issued an occupancy permit for such buildings. All construction and installation, including utilities, 
underground improvements, final grading and landscaping, must be complete before an occupancy 
permit may be issued. No occupancy permit shall be issued unless and until there is compliance with 
this section and the building, electrical and plumbing code of this city.  

(2) Temporary occupancy permits may be issued prior to the completion of the building or final grading 
and landscaping. No temporary occupancy permit shall be issued unless and until there is compliance 
with this section and the building, electrical and plumbing codes of this city. Once a temporary 
occupancy permit has expired, no person shall occupy that building or structure until an occupancy 
permit has been obtained as provided in subsection (C)(1) above.  

(a) Building incomplete. Temporary occupancy permits may be issued prior to the completion of the 
entire building, provided that such incomplete portion or portions shall be occupied safely. The 
building inspector shall fix the expiration dates for such temporary occupancy permits at the time 
of issuance.  

(b) Final grading and landscaping incomplete. A winter temporary occupancy permit may be issued 
for any occupancy occurring between November 15 and March 15. For all other occupancies, a 
30-day temporary occupancy permit may be issued if final grading and/or landscaping cannot be 
completed because of weather, construction delays or other unavoidable delay.  

(3) An occupancy permit or temporary occupancy permit may be issued if the driveway and/or sidewalks 
cannot be constructed because of weather, construction delays or other unavoidable delay, but in such 
case the owner of the premises shall provide the city with a bond in such form and in such amount as 
may be required by the city to insure such installation after occupancy is granted.  

(Ord. 1067, passed 6-20-89; Am. Ord. 06-04-04-02, passed 4-4-06; Am. Ord. 06-08-15-01, passed 8-18-06) Penalty, 
see Section 154.99 

154.09 Enforcement. 

The adoption of the BOCA National Building Code as herein provided is further modified so that wherever in 
any of said code it is provided that anything must be done to the approval of or subject to the direction of the 
enforcing officer, such officer shall have only the authority and power to determine whether the rules and 



 

 
Page 14 of 18 

regulations established by this chapter have been complied with, and shall not be construed as giving such officer 
discretionary powers.  

(Ord. 1056, passed 4-18-89) 

154.10 Spot survey. 

(A) Top of foundation survey. One copy of a top of foundation survey shall be submitted to and approved by the 
building inspector after the foundation walls have been completed and before the foundation wall inspection 
or further construction is undertaken, containing:  

(1) Exact location of the structure in relation to the lot lines;  

(2) Elevation for top of foundation, which shall not exceed three feet above curb level or, if no curb exists, 
three feet six inches above street level;  

(3) Rough grade elevations at the foundation and property lines, which must be within three inches of the 
final grade;  

(4) Stamp and signature of a registered land surveyor or a registered professional engineer, including the 
following statement: "The top of foundation survey fully complies with the approved engineering plans 
for the lot." In the event that the grading of the lot differs from the approved plans, a statement must 
be made as to the nature of the change. The building inspector may approve minor changes discovered 
during this top of foundation survey preparation, provided that the changes do not adversely affect the 
drainage on the land in question or other lands.  

(B) Spot survey. Prior to the issuance of an occupancy permit by the building inspector, the person requesting 
said occupancy permit for any building or lot shall file with the village a spot survey by a registered land 
surveyor of the state of Illinois depicting all lot lines, building lines, side yard lines and easements. Said 
survey should indicate all improvements and final grade elevations on said lot, and shall include to the top of 
foundation elevation as reference. In the event that the final grading of the lot differs from the approved 
plans, a statement must be made as to the nature of the change. The building inspector may approve minor 
changes discovered during this spot survey preparation, provided that the changes do not adversely affect 
the drainage on the land in question or other lands. No spot survey shall be required for a temporary 
occupancy permit.  

(Ord. 1517, passed 3-18-03; Am. Ord. 1632, passed 7-20-04; Am. Ord. 06-04-04-02, passed 4-4-06) 

154.11 Waste materials. 

(A) Neither the contractor nor the property owner shall allow waste materials to accumulate on the grounds of 
any property for which a permit has been issued pursuant to this chapter. The contractor and property 
owner shall ensure that such waste materials are deposited in on-site containers which are emptied at least 
once per week.  

(B) For the purposes of this section, "waste materials" shall include, but not be limited to, all trash, refuse and 
construction wastes.  

(Ord. 06-04-04-02, passed 4-4-06) 

154.12 Construction Hours. 

Construction or activities related to construction shall be permitted only during the following times: 
  
Weekdays  7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 
Saturdays  8:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 



 

 
Page 15 of 18 

Sundays and holidays 9:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m.  

154.13 Additional Construction Requirements. 

(A) Painting of Masonry. Existing exterior building masonry, brick, stone or similar shall not be painted 
without written approval from the building official. 

 
(B) Siding & Roofing Repair and Replacement. Removal of dissimilar siding and roofing materials is required 

for siding replacement and repairs. Roofing, siding, soffit, and fascia material shall match throughout the 
entire structure.  Special designs shall be approved in writing by the city prior to installation. Where 50% 
or more of a roof or siding is to be replaced, the entirety of the roof or siding shall be replaced as well 
unless approved otherwise in writing. 

 
(C) Mobile homes and modular construction is hereby prohibited. Structures whose work cannot be 

inspected prior to concealment is hereby prohibited.

154.99 Penalty. 

Any person, firm or corporation violating any provision in this title, for which another penalty is not provided, 
shall for a first conviction be fined not less than $25 nor more than $750, for a second conviction within one year 
thereafter, the person, firm or corporation shall be fined not less than $100 nor more than $750 and for a third or 
subsequent conviction within one year after the first conviction, the person, firm or corporation shall be fined not 
less than $250 nor more than $750. A separate offense shall be deemed committed on each day during or which a 
violation occurs or continues. (Am. Ord. 1047, passed 12-20-88; Am. Ord. 1051, 2-21-89; Am. Ord. 1056, 4-18-89; 
Ord. 1574, passed 7-15-03)  
 

SECTION 4:  PLUMBING CODE AMENDED  
 

That Chapter 155 – Plumbing Code is hereby amended to state in its entirety the 
following:  

Chapter 155 PLUMBING CODE 

155.01 Permit required. 

(A) Any person, firm, or corporation desiring to perform or carry on the work of plumbing, water supply, 
drainage and plumbing ventilation shall obtain a permit from the city. Such plumbing permit and any building 
permit issued by the city where plumbing work is required shall state the name, address, and phone number 
of the licensed plumber performing any plumbing work in connection with a plumbing permit or building 
permit. In addition, such permit shall give the state license number of any licensed plumber performing such 
work.  

(B) Third party consultant. The code official shall have the right to have permits be reviewed for code 
compliance by a plan review consultant and all costs shall be borne by the owner of the building or structure.  

(Ord. 657, passed 12-19-72; Am. Ord. 882, passed 5-3-83; Ord. 1512, passed 2-18-03) 

155.02 Fees. 

Before any permit is issued it shall be signed and approved by the plumbing inspector. Each applicant for a 
permit shall supply plans, materials lists, and the like required by the city prior to the issuance of a permit.  



 

 
Page 16 of 18 

(Ord. 1413, passed 3-20-02; Ord. 1512, passed 2-18-03) 

155.03 Plumbing license required. 

No permit shall be issued unless the person, firm, or corporation applying therefor holds a valid plumbing 
license issued by the State of Illinois. A homeowner may install or perform plumbing but may not employ any 
person other than a licensed plumber to assist in plumbing work.  

(Ord. 657, passed 12-19-72; Ord. 1512, passed 2-18-03) Penalty, see Section 155.99 

155.04 Reserved. 

155.05 Specifications and requirements. 

(A) There is hereby adopted by the city as a plumbing code for the city the current Illinois Plumbing Code, save 
and except such portions as are modified by the other provisions of this Chapter 154 and Chapter 155. At 
least three copies have been and are now filed in the office of the city clerk and the same are hereby 
adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. From June 1, 1989, the provisions thereof 
shall be controlling in the plumbing of all buildings and structures therein contained within the corporate 
limits of the city.  

(B) The actual connection of any sewer line or water line with the city's sanitary sewer system or water system 
shall be inspected by the city and installed by a licensed plumber.  

(C) Every property owner served by the city-owned water and sewer system shall conform to Chapters 50, 51, 
52, 53, and 54 of the Wilmington City Code of 1978 as amended.  

(D) Every restaurant operating within the city limits is required to install, maintain and clean on a periodic basis 
as needed, a grease trap. The city plumbing inspector shall inspect and approve such grease traps before 
they are installed, and shall thereafter inspect the same to see that it is in proper working order.  

(E) Water meters shall be furnished by the city at the owner's expense. All meters shall be supplied by the city 
with a Radio-Head system. All meters shall be tested, approved and sealed by the city water department. 
Any employee of the city finding a water meter broken shall immediately report the same to the 
superintendent of the water and sewer department.  

(F) Shut off boxes (buffalo boxes) shall be placed on every service pipe and each lot, building or residence shall 
be served by an individual line from the water main.  

(G) All service lines from the city-owned buffalo box to the building shall be installed and maintained by a 
licensed plumber; the property owner is responsible for all and any costs involved.  

(H) All service lines from the main to the meter shall be installed and maintained by a licensed plumber and shall 
be a minimum of not less than one inch in size for a single-family dwelling. 

(I) Every building shall be served separately and independently connected with a public sewer or water line 
when there is such in the street abutting on the lot or parcel occupied by such building.  

(J) The entire plumbing system of every building shall be separate and independent from that of any other 
building.  

(K) The sewer pipe for single-family dwellings shall be installed and maintained by a licensed plumber a 
minimum of six inches in diameter and shall have watertight, sealed joints. The sewer pipe for other than 
single-family dwellings shall be appropriately sized for the building and use of the building. These types of 
piping systems not approved: (1) aboveground galvanize W & V; or (2) PVC—Cell Core.  



 

 
Page 17 of 18 

(L) A six-inch sewer clean out with a "WYE" 45 connection or long sweep shall be installed and maintained by 
the homeowner or a licensed plumber within five feet of the outside of the outer perimeter of any building 
and shall be above ground level.  

(M) A triple basin separator shall be installed in all new commercial and industrial buildings that have a garage 
door or doors and floor drains. Added to keep original requirements changed by new state plumbing 
regulations; and  

(N) At the final inspection all plumbing must be completed, except for a completely roughed in future bathroom 
or bathrooms located in the basement area. Added to specify requirements at final inspection.  

(Ord. 657, passed 12-19-72; Am. Ord. 1009, passed 5-19-87; Am. Ord. 1056, passed 4-18-89; Am. Ord. 1068, passed 
6-20-89; Ord. 1512, passed 2-18-03; Am. Ord. 1630, passed 4-20-04; Am. Ord. 1641, passed 8-17-04) Penalty, see 
Section 155.99 

155.06 Inspection. 

All plumbing work shall be subject to an inspection by the plumbing inspector. No plumbing work or 
installation shall be covered before an inspection is performed and passed. Further, all violations will be corrected 
before any work or any installation is covered.  

(Ord. 657, passed 12-19-72; Ord. 1512, passed 2-18-03) Penalty, see Section 155.99 

155.07 Miscellaneous. 

All workmanship and materials and all plumbing installations or alterations shall conform in all respects to 
the latest rules and regulations of the Illinois Plumbing Code, except where the same conflicts with or is forbidden 
by the City of Wilmington.  

(Ord. 657, passed 12-19-72) 

155.08 Enforcement. 

The adoption of the Illinois Plumbing Code as herein provided is further modified so that wherever in any of 
said code it is provided that anything must be done to the approval of or subject to the direction of the enforcing 
officer, such officer shall have only the authority and power to determine whether the rules and regulations 
established by this chapter have been complied with, and shall not be construed as giving such officer 
discretionary powers.  

(Ord. 1056, passed 4-18-89) 

155.99 Penalty. 

Any person, firm or corporation violating any provision in this title, for which another penalty is not provided, 
shall for a first conviction be fined not less than $25 nor more than $750, for a second conviction within one year 
thereafter, the person, firm or corporation shall be fined not less than $100 nor more than $750 and for a third or 
subsequent conviction within one year after the first conviction, the person, firm or corporation shall be fined not 
less than $250 nor more than $750. A separate offense shall be deemed committed on each day during or which a 
violation occurs or continues.  

(Ord. 882, passed 5-3-83; Am. Ord. 1056, 4-18-89; Ord. 1574, passed 7-15-03) 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 
 



 

Page 18 of 18 

If any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, sentence or provision of this Ordinance 

shall be adjudged by any Court of competent jurisdiction to be invalid, such judgment shall 

not affect, impair, invalidate or nullify the remainder thereof, which remainder shall remain 

and continue in full force and effect 

SECTION 6: REPEALER 
  

All ordinances or parts of ordinances conflicting with any provisions of this ordinance 

are hereby repealed. 

  
SECTION 7:  EFFECTIVE DATE 
 

That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect after its adoption and approval, as 

provided by law, and effective starting on September 1, 2022. 

PASSED this ____ day of _____________, 2022 with _____ members voting aye, _____  

members voting nay, the Mayor voting _____, with _____ members abstaining or passing and said 

vote being: 

 

Kevin Kirwin   Ryan Jeffries  
Dennis Vice   Ryan Knight  
Leslie Allred     Jonathan Mietzner  
Todd Holmes   Thomas Smith  

 
 
Approved this _____ day of __________________, 2022    
     
        

 
Ben Dietz, Mayor 

 
Attest: 
 
 

 
Deputy City Clerk 

 







































City of Wilmington
Check Register Meeting Date: June 21, 2022

Check# Date Vendor/Employee Amount

Fund 1 General Corporate Fund

6/3/2022 Payroll Sweep 72,112.21          

6/3/2022 Paycor 620.49               

See attached 6/21/2022 VARIOUS 57,971.25          

Total: 130,703.95        

Fund 2 Water Operating M & R Fund

6/3/2022 Payroll Sweep 17,124.40          

See attached 6/21/2022 VARIOUS 15,272.90          

Total: 32,397.30          

Fund 4 Sewer Operating M & R Fund

6/3/2022 Payroll Sweep 15,933.06          

See attached 6/21/2022 VARIOUS 6,728.09            

Total: 22,661.15          

Fund 7 ESDA Fund

See attached 6/21/2022 VARIOUS 2,542.58            

Total: 2,542.58            

GRAND TOTAL: 188,304.98        

____________________ ______________________ ______________________
Dennis Vice Ryan Jeffries Jonathan Mietzner

____________________ ______________________ ______________________
Ryan Knight Kevin Kirwin Leslie Allred

____________________ ______________________ Approved:  June 21, 2022
Thomas Smith Todd Holmes            









































% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

GENERAL FUND REVENUES

Taxes

01-00-4020 PROPERTY TAXES - G/C 29,983                130,128              160,111                        364,547                       43.92%

01-00-4030 STATE SALES TAX 99,271                -                       99,271                           1,403,904                    7.07%

01-00-4050 MULTIPLE UTILITY TAXES 21,887                -                       21,887                           631,282                       3.47%

01-00-4060 HOTEL/MOTEL TAX 615                      -                       615                                6,000                            0.00%

01-00-4235 CABLE TV FRANCHISE FEE 21,776                -                       21,776                           84,000                          25.92%

01-00-4155 VIDEO GAMING TAX 19,912                -                       19,912                           200,000                       9.96%

01-03-4020 PROPERTY TAXES - POLICE DEPT. 20,528                89,094                109,622                        249,593                       43.92%

01-03-4021 PROPERTY TAX- POLICE PENSION 36,309                157,587              193,896                        445,090                       43.56%

01-05-4020 PROPERTY TAXES - ST & ALLEYS 8,231                   34,824                43,055                           -                                0.00%

01-09-4020 PROPERTY TAXES - FICA G/C 5,982                   25,961                31,943                           72,729                          43.92%

01-09-4021 PROPERTY TAXES - IMRF 1,607                   6,973                   8,580                             19,535                          43.92%

01-25-4020 PROPERTY TAXES GEN'L LIAB INS 3,980                   17,272                21,251                           48,386                          43.92%

01-25-4022 PROPERTY TAXES-W/COMP 3,980                   17,272                21,251                           48,386                          43.92%

Intergovernmental

01-00-4040 TWP R&B PPRT -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

01-00-4130 STATE PPRT 44,212                -                       44,212                           103,886                       42.56%

01-00-4150 STATE INCOME TAX (LGDF) 179,788              -                       179,788                        797,769                       22.54%

01-00-4153 LOCAL USE TAX 16,495                -                       16,495                           224,039                       7.36%

01-00-4154 PULL TAB / JAR GAMES TAX -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

01-00-4862 IPRF GRANT -                       -                       -                                 17,473                          0.00%

Licenses & Permits  

01-00-4230 BUSINESS REGISTRATION FEE 40                        -                       40                                   1,725                            2.32%

01-00-4232 ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT FEE 694                      -                       694                                9,000                            7.71%

01-00-4237 CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE 1,200                   -                       1,200                             20,000                          6.00%

01-00-4250 LICENSE - MISC. 375                      -                       375                                4,500                            8.33%

01-00-4252 CITY BEAUTIFICATION 250                      -                       250                                2,000                            0.00%

01-00-4270 LIQUOR LICENSES 800                      -                       800                                20,000                          4.00%

01-13-4290 BUILDING PERMIT FEES - CITY 10,290                4,405                   14,695                           560,000                       2.62%

01-13-4291 BUILDING INSPECTION FEES 4,630                   1,180                   5,810                             25,000                          23.24%

01-14-4540 PLANNING FEE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-14-4640 ZONING FEE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Fines & Forfeits

01-00-4251 TRUCK PERMITS - OVERWEIGHT 6,344                   -                       6,344                             50,000                          12.69%

01-00-4416 WPD RESTRICTED CONTRIBS K9 -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-00-4420 CIRCUIT CLERK COURT FINES 7,271                   -                       7,271                             39,500                          18.41%

01-00-4450 MISC. ORDINANCE FINES 2,870                   -                       2,870                             53,000                          5.42%

01-00-4455 IMPOUNDMENT FINE / SPEC TRNG -                       -                       -                                 2,700                            0.00%

01-00-4840 INSURANCE CLAIMS REIMBURSEMENTS 9,620                   -                       9,620                             22,000                          43.73%

Reimbursements

01-00-4870 OTHER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

01-00-4872 HEALTH/DENTAL INS. REIMBURSEMENTS 1,069                   -                       1,069                             12,840                          8.32%

01-00-4874 DEVELOPER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 308,166                       0.00%

01-13-4874 DEVELOPER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous

01-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME 1,489                   -                       1,489                             500                               297.83%

01-00-4858 OTHER INCOME - SPECIAL EVENTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-00-4859 OTHER INCOME - CATFISH DAYS 400                      -                       400                                22,000                          1.82%

01-00-4860 OTHER INCOME - MISC. 916                      -                       916                                32,000                          2.86%

01-00-4875 RENTAL OF PROPERTY 50                        -                       50                                   -                                0.00%

01-03-4860 OTHER INCOME MISC -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-00-4910 TRANSFER FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 575,943                       0.00%

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

TOTAL REVENUES: GENERAL FUND 562,861           484,697           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,047,558                  6,491,492                 16.14%

-                               

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION EXPENDITURES

Salaries & Wages

01-01-6010 WAGES -FINANCE & ADM. 17,838                8,899                   26,736                           256,519                       10.42%

01-01-6050 ELECTED/APPTD OFFICIALS WAGES 3,243                   -                       3,243                             31,432                          10.32%

01-01-6011 FICA TAXES 1,617                   657                      2,275                             18,872                          12.05%

01-01-6013 SUTA TAX 159                      30                        189                                2,284                            8.27%

Benefits

01-01-6014 IMRF 1,040                   -                       1,040                             19,320                          5.38%

01-01-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INSURANCE -                       3,388                   3,388                             30,994                          10.93%

01-01-6385 RETIRED EMPL HEALTH INS/DENTAL -                       7,449                   7,449                             93,600                          7.96%

Contractual Services

01-01-6320 AUDIT & ACCOUNTING SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 18,760                          0.00%

01-01-6335 PROF FEES - COMPUTER R&M 452                      1,395                   1,847                             15,000                          12.31%

01-01-6360 DUES SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS 5,265                   -                       5,265                             6,590                            79.89%

01-01-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 3,312                            0.00%

01-01-6460 LEGAL SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 40,000                          0.00%

01-01-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-01-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER 126                      362                      488                                45,000                          1.09%

01-01-6671 PAYROLL PROCESSING -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-01-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       1,175                   1,175                             15,600                          7.53%

01-01-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 4,000                            0.00%

01-01-6965 POSTAGE -                       200                      200                                1,000                            20.00%

01-01-7130 ECONOMIC DEVELOP COM EXP -                       -                       -                                 2,500                            0.00%

01-01-7180 POLICE COMMISSION EXP 675                      1,589                   2,264                             33,840                          6.69%

01-01-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT EXPENSE 784                      369                      1,153                             5,000                            23.06%

01-01-7940 SERVICE & INVESTMENT FEES -                       -                       -                                 100                               0.00%

01-01-7950 REFUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-01-7951 SALES TAX CREDIT -                       -                       -                                 -                                #DIV/0!

Supplies

01-01-6930 GASOLINE & OIL 63                        -                       63                                   1,000                            6.32%

01-01-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES 256                      150                      406                                2,500                            16.25%

01-01-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS -                       86                        86                                   -                                0.00%

01-01-7110 ADMIN MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-01-7150 MAYOR'S MISC. EXP -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

01-01-7155 COMMUNITY FESTIVALS -                       -                       -                                 10,000                          0.00%

01-01-7156 CATFISH DAYS EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 30,000                          0.00%

Miscellaneous

01-01-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-01-6640 MAINT-VEHICLES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-01-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       300                      300                                2,000                            0.00%

01-01-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

01-01-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-01-8021 CONTINGENCY -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-01-7151 FAÇADE IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM -                       -                       -                                 50,000                          100.00%

01-01-7157 CITY BEAUTIFICATION -                       425                      425                                -                                0.00%

Other Financing Uses

01-01-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 805,322                       0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION 31,519              26,473              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      57,992                        1,554,045                 3.73%

BUILDING & GROUNDS EXPENDITURES

Contractual

01-02-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

01-02-6530 MAINTENANCE - GROUNDS/BUILDING 3,969                   7,064                   11,033                           50,000                          22.07%

01-02-6531 PROF FESS - JANITORIAL -                       1,850                   1,850                             22,200                          8.33%

01-02-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER -                       -                       -                                 92,200                          0.00%

01-02-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-02-6810 UTILITIES 403                      118                      522                                2,500                            20.86%

Supplies

01-02-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS -                       -                       -                                 3,500                            0.00%

01-02-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-02-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: BUILDING & GROUNDS 4,372                 9,032                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      13,404                        173,400                     7.73%

POLICE EXPENDITURES 

Salaries and Wages

01-03-6010 WAGES - WPD 101,790              51,539                153,329                        1,468,633                    10.44%

01-03-6015 OVERTIME WAGES 6,899                   2,042                   8,941                             85,000                          10.52%

01-03-6020 PART TIME WAGES 4,081                   1,392                   5,473                             191,705                       2.85%

01-03-6030 CROSSING GUARD WAGES 570                      300                      870                                4,900                            17.76%

01-03-6035 VACATION/SICK TIME BUY-OUT -                       -                       -                                 30,000                          0.00%

01-03-6011 FICA TAX 8,429                   4,110                   12,539                           122,071                       10.27%

01-03-6013 SUTA TAX 834                      275                      1,108                             11,878                          9.33%

Benefits

01-03-6014 IMRF 231                      -                       231                                19,966                          0.00%

01-03-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INSURANCE 205                      23,133                23,338                           250,894                       9.30%

01-03-6685 POLICE PENSION CONTRIBUTION 36,309                157,587              193,896                        445,090                       43.56%

Contractual

01-03-6310 PROF FEES - ANIMAL CONTROL -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-03-6331 COMMUNITY SERVICE & AFFAIRS -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-03-6335 PROF FEES - COMPUTER R&M 1,358                   2,187                   3,545                             20,000                          17.73%

01-03-6340 PROF FEES - DISPATCH SVCS -                       16,204                16,204                           185,184                       8.75%

01-03-6360 DUES SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       1,780                   1,780                             12,500                          14.24%

01-03-6460 LEGAL SERVICES 2,238                   4,561                   6,798                             27,000                          25.18%

01-03-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       1,980                   1,980                             4,000                            49.50%

01-03-6640 MAINT-VEHICLES 256                      -                       256                                15,000                          1.71%

01-03-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-03-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER 595                      -                       595                                10,000                          5.95%

01-03-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET 155                      1,545                   1,700                             20,000                          8.50%

01-03-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 15,000                          0.00%

01-03-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT EXPENSE 224                      2,599                   2,823                             40,000                          7.06%

Supplies

01-03-6671 K-9 PROGRAM EXPENSES -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

01-03-6930 GASOLINE & OIL 3,539                   3,602                   7,142                             40,000                          17.85%

01-03-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       100                      100                                3,000                            3.33%

01-03-6965 POSTAGE -                       150                      150                                1,000                            15.00%

01-03-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS 152                      445                      597                                18,000                          3.32%

01-03-7010 UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES -                       1,388                   1,388                             20,000                          6.94%

Miscellaneous

01-03-6775 GRANT EXPENDITURES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-03-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-03-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES 686                      610                      1,296                             21,000                          6.17%

01-03-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

01-03-8020 TRANSFER TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: POLICE 168,550           277,530           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      446,081                      3,088,821                 14.44%

PUBLIC WORKS EXPENDITURES



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

Salaries and Wages

01-05-6010 WAGES - PW 20,718                12,328                33,047                           390,993                       8.45%

01-05-6015 OVERTIME WAGES 549                      87                        636                                10,000                          6.36%

01-05-6020 PART TIME WAGES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6011 FICA TAX 1,585                   913                      2,498                             25,895                          9.65%

01-05-6013 SUTA TAX 99                        88                        188                                4,112                            4.56%

Benefits

01-05-6014 IMRF 1,107                   -                       1,107                             32,820                          3.37%

01-05-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INSURANCE -                       5,093                   5,093                             53,515                          9.52%

Contractual

01-05-6335 PROF FEES - COMPUTER R&M -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-05-6360 DUES SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       222                      222                                500                               44.40%

01-05-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6440 PROF FEES - JULIE LOCATE -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

01-05-6670 PROF FEES- OTHER -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-05-6460 LEGAL SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6710 RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6740 STREET LIGHT ELECTRICITY 1,577                   15,978                17,555                           70,000                          25.08%

01-05-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       902                      902                                5,500                            16.40%

01-05-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

01-05-6780 TREE AND WEED REMOVAL -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6965 POSTAGE -                       50                        50                                   100                               50.00%

Supplies

01-05-6480 MAINT-BRIDGES -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

01-05-6500 MAINT-CURBS & GUTTERS -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

01-05-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT 8,013                   66                        8,079                             16,000                          50.49%

01-05-6570 MAINT-SIDEWALKS -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

01-05-6580 MAINT-STORM SEWERS -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

01-05-6590 MAINT-STREETS 508                      1,917                   2,425                             25,000                          9.70%

01-05-6640 MAINT-VEHICLES 1,529                   268                      1,797                             15,000                          11.98%

01-05-6785 MOWING -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6930 GASOLINE & OIL 1,800                   2,125                   3,924                             20,311                          19.32%

01-05-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-05-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS 613                      64                        677                                11,000                          6.15%

01-05-6990 SIGN REPLACEMENT -                       -                       -                                 2,500                            0.00%

01-05-7010 UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

01-05-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Debt Service

01-05-7323 EQUIP LOAN - PRINC 58,993                -                       58,993                           59,161                          99.72%

01-05-7324 EQUIP LOAN -  INTEREST 4,245                   -                       4,245                             4,077                            104.12%

Miscellaneous

01-05-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 10,000                          0.00%

01-05-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 47,500                          0.00%

01-05-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

01-05-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-05-6252 CITY BEAUTIFICATION -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: PUBLIC WORKS 101,336           40,102              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      141,438                      829,484                     17.05%

BUILDING DEPARTMENT EXPENDITURES

Salaries and Wages

01-13-6010 WAGES - BLDG. 1,667                   -                       1,667                             21,500                          7.75%

01-13-6011 FICA TAX 128                      -                       128                                1,645                            7.75%

01-13-6012 CITY ENGINEER SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

01-13-6013 SUTA TAX 59                        -                       59                                   758                               7.75%

Contractual

01-13-6337 CONSULTING FEE -                       -                       -                                 27,000                          0.00%

01-13-6360 DUES SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-13-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INRUANCE (2,357)                 2,357                   -                                 -                                0.00%

01-13-6460 LEGAL SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 100                               0.00%

01-13-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       42                        42                                   500                               8.46%

01-13-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-13-6965 POSTAGE -                       -                       -                                 100                               0.00%

Supplies

01-13-6335 PROF FEES- COMPUTER R & M -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-13-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-13-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-13-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-13-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-13-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: BUILING DEPARTMENT (504)                   2,399                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,895                           54,103                       3.50%

PLANNING & ZONING EXPENDITURES

Salaries and Wages

01-14-6010 WAGES - P & Z -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

01-14-6011 FICA TAX 7                           -                       7                                     15                                 44.73%

01-14-6013 SUTA TAX -                       -                       -                                 5                                    0.00%

Benefits

01-14-6014 IMRF -                       -                       -                                 15                                 0.00%

01-14-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INSURANCE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Contractual

01-14-6012 CITY ENGINEER SERVICES 90                        -                       90                                   -                                0.00%

01-14-6337 CONSULTING FEE -                       -                       -                                 17,500                          0.00%

01-14-6338 CONSULTING FEES - DEVELOPERS -                       560                      560                                62,000                          0.90%

01-14-6461 LEGAL SERVICES - DEVELOPERS -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-14-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

01-14-6965 POSTAGE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Supplies

01-14-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

01-14-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: PLANNING & ZONING 97                       560                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      657                               82,035                       0.80%

INSURANCE EXPENDITURES

Contractual

01-25-6470 PROP, EQUIP & LIAB. INS -                       -                       -                                 265,949                       0.00%

01-25-6690 W/COMP INS -                       15,122                15,122                           98,282                          15.39%

01-25-6691 LIABILITY INS. DEDUCTIBLE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: INSURANCE -                      15,122              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      15,122                        364,231                     4.15%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 562,861           484,697           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,047,558                  6,491,492                 16.14%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES 305,371           371,219           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      676,589                      6,146,119                 11.01%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 257,490           113,478           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      370,968                      345,373                     107.41%

WATER FUND

WATER CAPITAL REVENUES

Charges for Service

02-17-4610 WATER CAPACITY USER FEE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

02-17-4550 METER REPL PROGRAM FEES 25                        5,646                   5,672                             67,002                          8.47%

02-17-4555 WATER PLANT DEBT SERVICE FEE (689)                     24,813                24,123                           283,538                       8.51%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

02-17-4595 PENALTY FEE 2,622                   (85)                       2,537                             40,440                          6.27%

02-17-4680 WATER DIST SYS MAINT FEE -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

Investment Income

02-17-4850 INTEREST INCOME 345                      -                       345                                252                               137.16%

Miscellaneous

02-17-4875 RENTAL OF PROPERTY - TOWER LS -                       -                       -                                 7,605                            0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: WATER CAPITAL 2,303                 30,374              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      32,677                        400,837                     8.15%

WATER CAPITAL EXPENDITURES

Capital Projects

02-17-7400 CDBG WATER MAIN RPLMNT -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Contractual Services

02-17-6337 CONSULTING FEE -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

02-17-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 9,500                            0.00%

02-17-6460 LEGAL SERVICE FEES -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

Supplies

02-17-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

02-17-6620 MAINT - WATER METERS 64,722                1,438                   66,159                           150,000                       44.11%

Debt Service

02-17-7322 WATER CAPITAL PROJECTS -                       -                       -                                 471,500                       0.00%

17-00-7325 LOAN - CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous

02-17-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                                 175,000                       0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: WATER CAPITAL 64,722              1,438                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      66,159                        811,500                     8.15%

WATER OPERATIONS REVENUE

Charges for Service

02-21-4590 WATER SERVICE FEES 457                      104,744              105,200                        1,224,645                    8.59%

02-21-4610 WATER CAPACITY USER FEES -                       -                       -                                 2,500                            0.00%

02-21-4620 WATER METER FEES 2,535                   -                       2,535                             13,544                          18.71%

Investment Income

02-21-4850 INTEREST INCOME 2,059                   -                       2,059                             1,000                            205.90%

Reimbursements

02-21-4870 OTHER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 10,000                          0.00%

Miscellaneous

02-21-4860 OTHER INCOME - MISC. 525                      275                      800                                2,754                            29.05%

Other Financing Uses

02-21-4910 TRANSFERS FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: WATER OPERATIONS 5,575                 105,019           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      110,594                      1,254,443                 8.82%

WATER OPERATIONS EXPENDITURES

Salaries and Wages

02-21-6010 WAGES - WATER 35,175                17,692                52,867                           495,713                       10.66%

02-21-6015 OVERTIME WAGES 1,609                   865                      2,475                             32,000                          7.73%

02-21-6020 PART TIME WAGES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Benefits

02-21-6011 FICA TAXES - WATER DEPT 2,718                   1,371                   4,088                             28,757                          14.22%

02-21-6013 SUTA TAXES - WATER DEPT 97                        27                        123                                3,250                            3.79%

02-21-6014 IMRF - WATER DEPT 1,982                   -                       1,982                             43,877                          4.52%

02-21-6380 EE HEALTH INS. & LIFE INS. -                       8,546                   8,546                             122,611                       6.97%

02-21-6690 W/COMP INS -                       3,289                   3,289                             24,000                          13.70%

Contractual Services

02-21-6335 PROF FEES - COMPUTER R&M -                       49                        49                                   15,000                          0.33%

02-21-6337 PROF FEES - CONSULTING -                       -                       -                                 14,000                          0.00%

02-21-6360 DUES, SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

02-21-6460 LEGAL SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

02-21-6470 PROP, EQUIP, & LIABILTY INS -                       -                       -                                 96,498                          0.00%

02-21-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 40,000                          0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

02-21-6640 MAINT - VEHICLES -                       -                       -                                 1,200                            0.00%

02-21-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

02-21-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER - LABS -                       2,468                   2,468                             10,000                          24.68%

02-21-6671 TESTING & CALIBRATION -                       204                      204                                9,000                            2.27%

02-21-6674 PROF FEES PRINTING & DUP -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

02-21-6730 LIME/SLUDGE DISPOSAL -                       -                       -                                 32,000                          0.00%

02-21-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       435                      435                                5,500                            7.90%

02-21-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

02-21-6810 UTILITIES -                       3,697                   3,697                             60,000                          6.16%

02-21-7940 SERVICE INVESTMENT FEES -                       -                       -                                 9,750                            0.00%

02-21-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT EXPENSE -                       306                      306                                2,400                            12.74%

Supplies

02-21-6520 MAINT - WELL -                       -                       -                                 4,000                            0.00%

02-21-6530 MAINTENANCE - SITE GRNDS/BLDG -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

02-21-6540 MAINT - DISTRIBUTION -                       816                      816                                25,000                          3.26%

02-21-6610 MAINT - SITE PROCESS MAINS -                       -                       -                                 10,000                          0.00%

02-21-6620 MAINT - WATER METERS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

02-21-6625 MAINT - BSTRSTN / TOWERS -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

02-21-6930 GASOLINE & OIL -                       379                      379                                5,000                            7.58%

02-21-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       -                       -                                 4,700                            0.00%

02-21-6965 POSTAGE -                       300                      300                                1,500                            20.00%

02-21-6970 OP SUPPLIES AND TOOLS -                       122                      122                                20,000                          0.61%

02-21-7010 UNIFORMS & ACCESSORIES -                       236                      236                                1,000                            23.59%

02-21-7030 WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS -                       6,436                   6,436                             100,000                       6.44%

Debt Service

02-21-7928 WTR IEPA LOAN #2 PRINCIPLE -                       -                       -                                 29,787                          0.00%

02-21-7929 WTR IEPA LOAN #2 - INTEREST -                       -                       -                                 10,955                          0.00%

02-21-7932 WTR IEPA LOAN #1 PRINCIPLE -                       -                       -                                 24,960                          0.00%

02-21-7934 WTR IEPA LOAN #1 - INTEREST -                       -                       -                                 3,578                            0.00%

Miscellaneous

02-21-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

02-21-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 30,000                          0.00%

02-21-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 5,000                            0.00%

02-21-7950 REFUNDS -                       507                      507                                500                               101.38%

Other Financing Uses

02-21-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: WATER OPERATION 41,581              47,744              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      89,325                        1,338,536                 6.67%

Garbage Service Revenue

Charges for Service

02-23-4530 GARBAGE COLLECTION FEES 219                      40,074                40,293                           504,474                       7.99%

GARBAGE EXPENDITURES

Contractual

02-23-6420 GARBAGE COLLECTION EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 537,508                       0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: GARBAGE -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                537,508                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES *8097.89 175,467           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      183,565                      2,159,755                 8.50%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES 106,303           49,181              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      155,484                      2,687,544                 5.79%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) (98,205)             126,286           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      28,081                        (527,790)                   -5.32%

* The May 1 utility bill had a journal entry date in April 2022.  An adjustment will be made next month to move water revenue into May.

SEWER FUND

SEWER OPERATIONS REVENUE

Charges for Service

04-00-4560 SEWER SERVICE FEES 487                      95,246                95,733                           1,126,107                    8.50%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

04-00-4570 SEWER CAPACITY USER FEE -                       -                       -                                 94,240                          0.00%

Reimbursements

04-00-4870 OTHER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous

04-00-4860 OTHER INCOME - MISC 50                        50                        100                                1,000                            10.00%

Other Financing Uses

04-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-00-4910 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: SEWER OPERATIONS 537                    95,296              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      95,833                        1,221,347                 7.85%

SEWER OPERATIONS EXPENDITURES

Salaries and Wages

04-00-6010 WAGES & SALARIES 33,020                16,601                49,621                           472,249                       10.51%

04-00-6015 OVERTIME WAGES 1,125                   280                      1,405                             15,914                          8.83%

04-00-6020 PT WAGES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Benefits

04-00-6011 FICA TAXES 2,511                   1,240                   3,751                             28,038                          13.38%

04-00-6013 SUTA TAXES 97                        27                        123                                3,335                            3.69%

04-00-6014 IMRF/SLEP CONTRIBUTIONS 1,813                   -                       1,813                             41,800                          4.34%

04-00-6380 EMPLOYEE HEALTH & LIFE INS -                       7,900                   7,900                             107,758                       7.33%

Contractual Services

04-00-6335 PROF FEES - COMPUTER R&M -                       49                        49                                   12,000                          0.41%

04-00-6360 DUES, SUPSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

04-00-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-00-6470 PROP, EQUIP, & LIAB INSURANCE -                       -                       -                                 91,902                          0.00%

04-00-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       339                      339                                25,000                          1.36%

04-00-6640 MAINT - VEHICLES -                       -                       -                                 29,000                          0.00%

04-00-6671 TESTING AND CALIBRATION -                       1,808                   1,808                             39,000                          4.64%

04-00-6650 NOTICES/LEGAL PUBLICATIONS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

04-00-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

04-00-6690 W/ COMP INSURANCE -                       2,977                   2,977                             19,845                          15.00%

04-00-6730 LIME & SLUDGE DISPOSAL -                       -                       -                                 34,131                          0.00%

04-00-6760 TELE/INTERNET SERVICE -                       516                      516                                5,000                            10.31%

04-00-7940 SERVICE & INVESTMENT FEES -                       -                       -                                 9,000                            0.00%

Supplies

04-00-6530 MAINTENANCE - GRNDS/BLDG 134                      1,220                   1,354                             16,500                          8.21%

04-00-6560 MAINT - SWRS COLLECTION/LIFT STN -                       -                       -                                 24,000                          0.00%

04-00-6561 MAINT - SWRS - PROCESS -                       2,320                   2,320                             40,000                          5.80%

04-00-6674 PROF FEES- PRINTING 7 DUPLIC -                       -                       -                                 3,000                            0.00%

04-00-6770 TRAINING, MTG, & TRAVEL -                       -                       -                                 4,000                            0.00%

04-00-6810 UTILITIES -                       4,112                   4,112                             85,000                          4.84%

04-00-6930 GASOLINE & OIL -                       316                      316                                5,000                            6.32%

04-00-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       609                      609                                3,000                            20.31%

04-00-6965 POSTAGE -                       300                      300                                1,000                            30.00%

04-00-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS 21                        1,488                   1,509                             20,000                          7.54%

04-00-6985 SEWER CHEMICALS -                       65                        65                                   65,000                          0.10%

04-00-7010 UNIFORMS & ACCESORY -                       -                       -                                 1,500                            0.00%

Debt Service

04-00-7935 IEPA ARS BND SERIES '20 PRIN. -                       -                       -                                 735,000                       0.00%

04-00-7936 IEPA ARS BND SERIES '20 INT. -                       -                       -                                 142,800                       0.00%

Miscellaneous

04-00-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

04-00-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT -                       306                      306                                1,000                            30.58%

04-00-7360 EXPENSED EQUIP. -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

04-00-7950 REFUNDS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

Other Financing Uses

04-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: SEWER OPERATION 38,720              42,473              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      81,194                        2,088,772                 3.89%

SEWER CAPITAL REVENUES

Charges for Service

04-03-4555 WWTP DEBT SERVICE REVNUE (2,757)                 96,307                93,550                           1,149,945                    8.14%

04-03-4580 SEWER COLLCTN SYS. MAINT FEE -                       -                       -                                 6,000                            0.00%

04-03-4595 PENALTY FEE 3,165                   (86)                       3,079                             40,000                          7.70%

Investment Income

04-03-4850 INTEREST INCOME 167                      -                       167                                74                                 225.24%

Miscellaneous

04-03-4875 RENTAL OF PROPERTY - TOWER LS (2,000)                 -                       (2,000)                            23,780                          -8.41%

Other Financing Uses

04-03-4910 TRANSFERS FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: SEWER CAPITAL (1,425)               96,221              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      94,795                        1,219,799                 7.77%

SEWER CAPITAL EXPENDITURES

Contractual Services

04-03-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 117,000                       0.00%

04-03-6460 LEGAL SERVICES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-03-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-03-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 278,000                       0.00%

04-03-7325 LOAN - CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-03-7430 SEWER COLLECTION LINE UPGRADE -                       -                       -                                 50,000                          0.00%

04-03-7450 MISC. OTHER CPAITAL PROJECTS -                       -                       -                                 395,000                       0.00%

04-03-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous

04-03-7160 MISC. EXPENSE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

04-03-8021 CONTINGENCY -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: SEWER CAPITAL -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                840,000                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES *-888.1 191,517           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      190,629                      2,441,146                 7.81%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES 38,720              42,473              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      81,194                        2,928,772                 2.77%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) (39,609)             149,044           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      109,435                      (487,626)                   -22.44%

* The May 01 utility bill had a journal entry date in April 2022.  An adjustment will be made next month to move sewer revenue into May.

MOTOR FUEL TAX REVENUES

Taxes

06-00-4120 MFT STATE ALLOTMENTS 11,114                -                       11,114                           133,104                       8.35%

06-00-4121 TRANSPORTATION RENEWAL 8,094                   -                       8,094                             100,253                       8.07%

06-00-4122 REBUILD IL -                       -                       -                                 62,872                          0.00%

Intergovernmental

06-00-4110 GRANTS - FEDERAL -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Investment Income

06-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME 581                      -                       581                                500                               116.28%

Miscellaneous

06-00-4860 OTHER INCOME - MICS. -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

06-00-4910 XFER FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: MOTOR FUEL TAX 
19,789              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      

19,789                        297,729                     6.65%

MOTOR FUEL TAX EXPENDITURES

Contractual Services

06-00-6596 MISC. MFT PROJECTS - PRIOR YRS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

06-00-6595 MFT PROJECTS CURRENT YEAR -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Supplies

06-00-6983 SALT & CINDERS -                       -                       -                                 35,000                          0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

Miscellaneous

06-00-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

06-00-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: MOTOR FUEL TAX -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                35,000                       0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 19,789              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      19,789                        297,729                     6.65%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                35,000                       0.00%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 19,789              -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      19,789                        262,729                     7.53%

ESDA REVENUES

Taxes

07-00-4020 PROPERTY TAXES - ESDA 111                      483                      594                                2,104                            28.23%

Intergovernmental

07-00-4160 GRANTS - STATE -                       -                       -                                 32,000                          0.00%

Reimbursements

07-00-4870 OTHER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

Miscellaneous

07-00-4860 OTHER INC. - MISC. -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Other Financing Uses

07-00-4910 TRANSFERS FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 88,324                          0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: ESDA 111                    483                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      594                               122,928                     0.48%

ESDA EXPENDITURES

Salaries and Wages

07-00-6010 WAGES- ESDA 3,750                   -                       3,750                             15,900                          23.58%

Benefits

07-00-6011 FICA TAX 287                      -                       287                                1,216                            23.59%

07-00-6013 SUTA TAX 132                      -                       132                                600                               22.03%

Contractual Services

07-00-6340 PROF FEES - DISPATCH SVS -                       25                        25                                   500                               5.04%

07-00-6360 DUES SUBSCRP. & MEMBERSHIPS -                       -                       -                                 1,800                            0.00%

07-00-6510 MAINTENANCE - EQUIPMENT -                       165                      165                                1,000                            16.50%

07-00-6550 MAINT - RADIOS & PAGERS -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

07-00-6640 MAINT - VEHICLES -                       -                       -                                 1,650                            0.00%

07-00-6670 PROF FEES - OTHER -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

07-00-6760 TELEPHONE/INTERNET -                       696                      696                                10,000                          6.96%

07-00-6817 SUBSCRIPTION WEATHER SERVICE -                       -                       -                                 150                               0.00%

07-00-7321 LEASED EQUIPMENT EXPENSE -                       1,825                   1,825                             21,900                          8.33%

Supplies

07-00-6770 TRAINING, MTG & TRAVEL -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

07-00-6930 GASOLINE & OIL 253                      253                      506                                2,210                            22.88%

07-00-6960 OFFICE SUPPLIES -                       -                       -                                 1,000                            0.00%

07-00-6970 OPER SUPPLIES AND TOOLS 18                        368                      386                                5,000                            7.71%

Miscellaneous

07-00-7320 EQUIPMENT PURCHASES -                       -                       -                                 7,000                            0.00%

07-00-7360 EXPENSED EQUIPMENT -                       -                       -                                 500                               0.00%

Other Financing Uses

07-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 50,000                          0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: ESDA 4,440                 3,332                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      7,772                           122,926                     6.32%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 111                    483                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      594                               122,928                     0.48%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES 4,440                 3,332                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      7,772                           122,926                     6.32%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) (4,329)               (2,849)               -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      (7,178)                          2                                   -414886.71%

DEBT SERVICE REVENUE

Taxes

12-00-4025 SSA DEER RIDGE SUBD REPAYMENTS -                       1,941                   1,941                             32,000                          6.07%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

Investment Income

12-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME 45                        -                       45                                   100                               44.77%

Other Financing Uses

12-00-4900 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

12-00-4860 OTHER INCOME MISC -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: DEBT SERVICE 45                       1,941                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,986                           32,100                       6.19%

DEBT SERVICES EXPENDITURES

Debt Service

12-00-7920 SSA 2008 SERIES BOND - PRINCIPLE -                       -                       -                                 30,000                          0.00%

12-00-7922 SERIES 2020 ARS BOND PRINCIPLE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

12-00-7923 SERIES 2020 ARS BOND INTEREST -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

12-00-7930 SSA 2008 SERIES BOND - INTEREST -                       -                       -                                 1,950                            0.00%

12-00-7931 SERIES 2015 ARS BOND PRINCIPAL -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

12-00-7933 SERIES 2015 ARS BONDS INT. -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Contractual Services

12-00-7940 SERVICE & INVESTMENT FEES -                       -                       -                                 100                               0.00%

Miscellaneous

12-00-7160 MISC EXPENSE 3                           -                       3                                     100                               3.00%

12-00-8021 CONTINGENCY -                       -                       -                                 581,165                       0.00%

Other Financing Uses

12-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: DEBT SERVICE 3                          -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      3                                    613,315                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 45                       1,941                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,986                           32,100                       6.19%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES 3                          -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      3                                    613,315                     0.00%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 42                       1,941                 -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,983                           (581,215)                   -0.34%

MOBILE EQUIPMENT FUND REVENUE

Miscellaneous

21-00-4911 PUBLIC WORKS VEHICLE REPLCMNT -                       -                       -                                 117,000                       0.00%

21-00-4912 WPD VEHICLE FINES & TRANSFERS -                       -                       -                                 2,000                            0.00%

21-00-4915 ESDA VEHICLE MEF REPLCMNT -                       -                       -                                 50,000                          0.00%

21-00-4916 PD VEHICLE REPLACEMENT -                       -                       -                                 100,000                       0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: MOBILE EQUIPMENT FUND -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                269,000                     0.00%

MOBILE EQUIPMENT FUND EXPENDITURES

Miscellaneous

21-00-7410 WPD MEF VEHICLE PURCHASE -                       -                       -                                 100,000                       0.00%

21-00-7411 PUBLIC WORKS VEHICLE PURCHASE -                       -                       -                                 117,000                       0.00%

21-00-7412 ESDA MEF VEHICLE PURCHASE -                       -                       -                                 50,000                          0.00%

Other Financing Uses

21-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: MOBILE EQUIPMENT FUND -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                267,000                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                269,000                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                267,000                     0.00%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) -                      -                      20                       -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                2,000                          0.00%

CAPITAL PROJECT FUND REVENUE

Intergovernmental

24-00-4883 EDP-RT 53/N RIVER RD -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4886 EDP-SO. ARS/RT 53 -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4887 EDP-RT 53/PEOTONE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4889 WILL CO-RT 53/PEOTONE RD -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Debt Service

24-00-4843 BOND PROCEEDS-ANNUAL SERIES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

Investment Income

24-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME 102                      -                       102                                -                                0.00%

Reimbursements

24-00-4870 OTHER REIMBURSEMENTS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous

24-00-4110 GRANTS-IDOT KKK ST/FKD CRK B -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4160 GRANTS-STATE -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4860 OTHER INCOME - MISC. -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4871 DEVELOPERS FEES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-4872 ARPA FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 384,246                       0.00%

Other Financing Uses

24-00-4910 TRANSFERS FROM OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 500,000                       0.00%

TOTAL REVENUES: CAPITAL PROJECTS FUND 102                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      102                               884,246                     0.01%

CAPITAL PROJECT FUND EXPENDITURES

Contractual Services

24-00-6390 PROF FEES - ENGINEERING -                       -                       -                                 35,000                          -100.00%

24-00-6670 PROF FEES-OTHER -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

24-00-7315 KKK ST/FKD CRK BRIDGE PROJ EXP -                       -                       -                                 28,612                          0.00%

24-00-7415 USCS/IDOT RTE 52/PEOTONE RD -                       -                       -                                 46,708                          0.00%

24-00-7440 IDOT RT 53/N RIVER RD PROJECT -                       -                       -                                 15,000                          0.00%

24-00-7449 S ARSENAL/RT 53 IDOT/EDP -                       -                       -                                 131,327                       0.00%

24-00-7450 MISC OTHER CAP PROJECTS -                       -                       -                                 200,000                       0.00%

24-00-7940 SERVICE & INVESTMENT FEES -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Miscellaneous -                                    

24-00-8021 CONTINGENCY -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

Other Financing Uses

24-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: CAPITAL PROJECT FUND -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                456,647                     0.00%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 102                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      102                               884,246                     0.01%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                                456,647                     0.00%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 102                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      102                               427,599                     0.02%

RIDGE PORT TIF #2 FUND

Taxes

25-00-4020 PROPERTY TAXES-RIDGE PORT TIF 404,607              1,043,788           1,448,395                     6,282,576                    23.05%

Investment Income

25-00-4850 INTEREST INCOME 9                           -                       9                                     100                               9.25%

TOTAL REVENUES: RIDGE PORT TIF #2 FUND 404,616           1,043,788        -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                       1,448,404                  6,282,676                 23.05%

RIDGE PORT TIF #2 FUND EXPENDITURES

Contractual Services

25-00-7171 TIF-PROF FEES/ADMIN -                       890                      890                                25,000                          3.56%

25-00-7172 TIF ADMIN OVERAGE EXPPNS -                       -                       -                                 75,000                          0.00%

Miscellaneous

25-00-7170 DEVELOPER DISTRIBUTION EXPNS -                       -                       -                                 6,120,413                    0.00%

25-00-8020 TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS -                       -                       -                                 -                                0.00%

TOTAL EXPENDITURES: RIDGE PORT TIF #2 FUND -                      890                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      890                               6,220,413                 0.01%

TOTAL FUND REVENUES 404,616           1,043,788        -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,448,404                  6,282,676                 23.05%

TOTAL FUND EXPENDITURES -                      890                    -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      890                               6,220,413                 0.01%

FUND SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 404,616           1,042,898        -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,447,514                  62,263                       0.00%

TOTAL CITY REVENUES 994,734           1,897,891        -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      2,892,626                  18,981,072              15.24%



% of Fiscal Year
8% 17% 25% 33% 42% 50% 58% 67% 75% 83% 92% 100% Year-to-Date  FISCAL YEAR 2023 

ACCOUNT NUMBER DESCRIPTION May-22 June-22 July-22 August-22 September-22 October-22 November-22 December-22 January-23 February-23 March-23 April-23 Totals  BUDGET % of Budget

CITY OF WILMINGTON

FISCAL YEAR 2023 BUDGET REPORT

For the Month Ended June 30, 2022

TOTAL CITY EXPENDITURES 454,837           467,094           -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      921,931                      19,477,736              4.73%

CITY SURPLUS (DEFICIT) 539,898           1,430,797        -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      -                      1,970,695                  (496,665)                   -396.79%














	22-06-21-01  Encourage Economic Growth.pdf
	SECTION 1: WAIVER OF IMPACT FEES
	SECTION 2: WAIVER OF CONNECTION FEES
	SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY
	SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE

	Ordinance- Building Code Amendments 061522.pdf
	Chapter 154 BUILDING CODE
	154.01 Adoption of building code.
	154.02 Definitions.
	154.03 Fees.
	154.03.1 Inspection fees.
	154.03.2 New industrial and commercial construction inspection fees.
	154.04 Building and demolition permits.
	154.05 Saving clause—Pending court cases.
	154.06 Fire limits.
	154.07 Fire resistance.
	154.08 Driveways, sidewalks and occupancy permits.
	154.09 Enforcement.
	154.10 Spot survey.
	154.11 Waste materials.
	154.12 Construction Hours.
	154.13 Additional Construction Requirements.
	154.99 Penalty.

	Chapter 155 PLUMBING CODE
	155.01 Permit required.
	155.02 Fees.
	155.03 Plumbing license required.
	155.04 Reserved.
	155.05 Specifications and requirements.
	155.06 Inspection.
	155.07 Miscellaneous.
	155.08 Enforcement.
	155.99 Penalty.


	22-06-21-01  Encourage Economic Growth.pdf
	SECTION 1: WAIVER OF IMPACT FEES
	SECTION 2: WAIVER OF CONNECTION FEES
	SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY
	SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE

	Ordinance- Building Code Amendments 061722 v3.pdf
	Chapter 154 BUILDING CODE
	154.01 Adoption of building code.
	154.02 Definitions.
	154.03 Fees.
	154.03.1 Inspection fees.
	154.03.2 New industrial and commercial construction inspection fees.
	154.04 Building and demolition permits.
	154.05 Saving clause—Pending court cases.
	154.06 Fire limits.
	154.07 Fire resistance.
	154.08 Driveways, sidewalks and occupancy permits.
	154.09 Enforcement.
	154.10 Spot survey.
	154.11 Waste materials.
	154.12 Construction Hours.
	154.13 Additional Construction Requirements.
	154.99 Penalty.

	Chapter 155 PLUMBING CODE
	155.01 Permit required.
	155.02 Fees.
	155.03 Plumbing license required.
	155.04 Reserved.
	155.05 Specifications and requirements.
	155.06 Inspection.
	155.07 Miscellaneous.
	155.08 Enforcement.
	155.99 Penalty.


	06.21.22 Check Register.pdf
	06.21.22 Check Register.pdf
	06.21.22 Check Register

	SKM_C55822061611240.pdf




